TAX SALE JUNE 2022 - SOLD

PARCEL ID OWNER ADDRESS BIDDER STARTING BID PURCHASE PRICE EXCESS FUNDS
1003707009 _|GRAY ROBERT E 116 BREVARD POINT RD 31410 TOES IN THE WATER SASS IN THE SAND LLC $ 1,786.32 | $ 6,900.00 | $ 5,113.68
In Rem against the property known as MARSH LOT 93A WIP & | CO SUB EAST BLVD 31410, said property being formerly in the name of T8S
1009911012 _|INVESTMENTS. EAST BLVD 31410 NO BID $ 3,012.15 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 4 PLOT 68 HOMESTEAD PARK ALBERT ST 31406, said property being formerly in the name of WINGSTER
1037505011 _|LUCINDA, deceased ALBERT ST 31406 AHTE 6, LLC $ 1,552.95 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 6,147.05
1037802021 _|FONSEKA JOSHUA & SUMITTE CHRISTINA* BEACHWOOD AVE 31406 HENRIETTA HILLS $ 1,050.68 | 6,000.00 | $ 4,949.32
In Rem against the property known as PT OF LOTS A & B THOMAS SUB THOMAS AVE 31406, said property being formerly in the name of PARKER
1042802013 | JOHNNY JR EST OF, deceased THOMAS AVE 31406 JAMES WRIGHT $ 93933 | § 5,000.00 | $ 4,060.67
In Rem against the property known as ONE HALF ACRE IN PORTION OF LEE CHEVIS RD 31419, said property being formerly in the name of MILLS
11003A02008 | TURNER & CARRIE, deceased CHEVIS RD 31419 NO BID $ 2,747.92 | $ - s -
11004110075 _|HALLMARK DEVELOPMENT CO INC WILD HERON VILLAS RD 31419 SHARON GRAY $ 1,787.45 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 6,212.55
11029801039 _|HALL STEPHEN R OGEECHEE RD 31419 PHILLIP FERREBEE $ 1,181.69 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 351831
In Rem against the property known as LOT 4 BLOCK A28 PINE GARDENS SUB 2236 UTAH ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of
2000909016 | BROWN WALTER MAC, deceased 2236 UTAH ST 31404 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 1,289.65 | $ 27,500.00 | 26,210.35
2002304023 | ROBINSON THERESA KRENSON ST 31415 JAMES WRIGHT $ 97773 | § 4,000.00 | $ 3,022.27
In Rem against the property known as 34 X 132 OF LOT 5 BLK A ROBERTS ST 31408, said property being formerly in the name of THOMAS
2002409003 | GWENDOLYN, deceased ROBERTS ST 31408 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,430.57 | $ 5,100.00 | $ 3,669.43
2002705004 | SKIPPER BERNITHA 207 MILLEN ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 83857 | S 12,200.00 [ § 1131143
In Rem against the property known as 124 CLAY WARD 235 MILLEN ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of BOXTON ELIZABETH,
2002705017 | deceased 235 MILLEN ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 3,404.51 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 13,395.49
2002709008 | MCGILL SANDRA & ISAIAH 1802 DEXTER ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,101.61 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 4,598.39
In Rem against the property known as LOT 22 BLOCK D GLEN WARD 1420 COMER ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of HILLS
2002801021 _|ROSELLA, deceased 1420 COMER ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,254.21 | $ 10,700.00 | $ 9,445.79
In Rem against the property known as LOT 10 BLK E GLEN WD 1317 NEW CASTLE ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of RANKIN
2002802010 | DAVID, deceased 1317 NEW CASTLE ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,044.21 | $ 14,500.00 | 13,455.79
2002901022 | XU YAN 201 GLASS ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,971.67 | $ 21,000.00 [ $ 19,028.33
2003306025 _|K C PLUMBING 508 £ HUNTINGDON ST 31401 ARACELI MORALES $ 1,973.83 | $ 6,900.00 | $ 4,926.17
In Rem against the property known as LOT 81 STILES TERRACE GAMBLE WD 1106 STILES AVE 31415, said property being formerly in the name of
20046 10016 | FUTCH MARY LOUISE, deceased 1106 STILES AVE 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,105.50 | $ 12,900.00 | 11,794.50
2004707001 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* 25 BARBER AVE 31415 JAMES WRIGHT s 969.95 [ 4,000.00 [ $ 3,030.05
In Rem against the property known as 179 AND 180 MORRISON WD STOKES ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of HAYES JOE R,
20047 24008 | deceased STOKES ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,031.13 | $ 17,700.00 | $ 16,668.87
2005004001 | BARNWELL ANTONIO T PITT ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,034.82 | $ 25,100.00 | 24,065.18
In Rem against the property known as 110 111 GAMBLE WD ELLIOTT AVE 31415, said property being formerly in the name of THOMAS DORA &
2005026019 _|SING, deceased ELLIOTT AVE 31415 EDWARD WRIGHT $ 1,029.28 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 24,970.72
20054 13011 | FINE CARRIE LEGRAND ST 31401 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 1,988.21 | $ 46,000.00 | $ 44,011.79
In Rem against the property known as SOUTH HALF OF LOT 1 BLOCK 11 SCH ANDERSON ST 31401, said property being formerly in the name of
20054 14004 | ELMAN & SADLER BERNICE & MARSH & RUTH S, deceased ANDERSON ST 31401 DENNIS GRAYSON $ 1,297.63 | $ 1,297.63 | $ -
20054 25005 | BLAKE MALWORSTH 1608 REYNOLDS ST 31401 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 2,004.56 | $ 46,000.00 | $ 43,995.44
20054 25009 | THOMAS BERNADETTE 643 E 32ND ST 31401 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC s 1,12585 | $ 41,000.00 | $ 39,874.15
20056 22007 | HERBST DAVID S 1308 E 35TH ST 31404 TAMIKA MUTCHERSON $ 2,943.96 | $ 21,000.00 | § 18,056.04
20058 010014 _|KC PLUMBING MOSLEY ST 31404 JAMES WRIGHT $ 2,147.81 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 7,852.19
In Rem against the property known as LOT 41 BLOCK 2 JENKINS WARD HANSON ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of LAWTON &
2005802018 | STEVENS WILLIE & MAGG, deceased HANSON ST 31404 NO BID $ 1,309.81 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 21 BLOCK 1 MEYER WARD 2129 E GWINNETT ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of
2005805021 | WILLIAMS ALFRED, deceased 2129 E GWINNETT ST 31404 JULIA M SPENCER $ 2,457.52 | $ 2,457.52 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 154 BLOCK 2 MEYER WARD 2105 BOLLING ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of
2005811012 | WILLIAMS OPHELIA, deceased 2105 BOLLING ST 31404 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,706.15 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 9,793.85
2005813011 | CAESAR ISAAC ALASKA ST 31404 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 113023 | $ 17,800.00 [ $ 16,669.77
20058 25006 | SANDERS CARMEL W AS EXECUTOR* 2115 MISSISSIPPI AVE 31404 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 246513 | $ 26,000.00 | 23,534.87
2005837005 | HALL CHRISTOPHER P 0 E GWINNETT ST 31404 NO BID $ 89253 | - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 1 AND 2 AND WEST 19 FEET OF 1201 E 36TH ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of
2006219010 | MILLER GLENN A, deceased 1201 E 36TH ST 31404 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 2,350.60 | $ 44,000.00 | $ 41,649.40
In Rem against the property known as E 25 FT LOT 106 OLIVER WD 1110 NE 36TH ST 31404, said property being formerly in the name of TBS
2006303015 | INVESTMENTS. 1110 NE 36TH ST 31404 MARIA ALLEN-LEE $ 994.72 | $ 10,500.00 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as NORTHWEST 2 X 78 FEET OF LOT 106 1804 REYNOLDS ST 31401, said property being formerly in the name of
20064 15001 |HHO'S, deceased 1804 REYNOLDS ST 31401 AWSE AFFORDABLE HOMES 2, LLC $ 1,125.85 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 46,874.15
20066 20012 | JOHNSON PETE 705 W 34TH ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,146.59 | $ 17,500.00 | 16,353.41
20067 14006 | HERBST DAVID TERRACE ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,095.60 | $ 10,500.00 [ $ 9,404.31
2006806004__|JACKSON KENNETH 1244 CARR ST 31415 JAMES WRIGHT $ 865.83 | § 16,000.00 | 15,134.17
In Rem against the property known as LOT G DEMERE WARD EAST 5 FEET 834 W 39TH ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of AIR
2007302045 | ATHENS CORPORATION INC. 834 W 39TH ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,062.90 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 9,437.10
2007317004 | HERBST DAVID 2303 FLORANCE ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,204.91 | $ 14,000.00 [ $ 12,795.09
In Rem against the property known as 123 DEMERE WD 906 MORAY ST 31415, said property being formerly in the name of WILLIAMS ROBERT E,
2007319017 | deceased 906 MORAY ST 31415 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,406.97 | $ 15,500.00 | $ 14,093.03
2007323010 | DAUGHTRY GRANFUS 905 W 40TH ST 31415 WILLIAM SMITH $ 4,347.06 | § 26,000.00 | 21,652.94
In Rem against the property known as LOT 63 GARFUNKEL WD W 48TH ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of SAVANNAH
20089 19005 | DREAMAKER HOMES LLC. W 48TH ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,165.75 | $ 18,000.00 | 16,834.25
In Rem against the property known as LOT 56 GARFUNKEL WD 824 W 48TH ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of GOLDWIRE
2008919021 _|BOISY, deceased 824 W 48TH ST 31405 KINDALL L GRANT $ 1,165.75 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 24,834.25




2008921016 | WILLIAMS JAMES E 47TH ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 115841 $ 15,500.00 [ 14,341.59
2008921017 | WILLIAMS JAMES E 628 ORCHARD ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 115841 S 20,500.00 [ $ 19,341.59
In Rem against the property known as LOT 6 BLOCK G COLDING WARD PERTH ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of TBS
2008929022 | INVESTMENTS. PERTH ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,170.56 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 15,329.44
2010009002 |ROBERTS B J COAKLEY ST 31404 JAMES WRIGHT $ 1,045.04 | $ 12,000.00 | § 10,954.96
2010009003 |ROBERTS B J COAKLEY ST 31404 SHANTELE DELMAR $ 1,045.04 | $ 1,045.04 | $ -
2010009036 |ROBERTS B J 2348 JURGENSEN ST 31404 MARIA ALLEN-LEE $ 111812 | $ 11,000.00 | § 9,881.88
2010905009 | SCOTT & KINSTLER ANN K & HERBERT P AS CO GEORGIA ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,050.53 | $ - s -
20109 08006 | MORELAND TANEKIA HOWARD ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,366.08 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as 13 BLK F TATEMVILLE ADEL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of WILCOX LEANNA TANNER
2010908021 _|ET AL, deceased ADEL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,169.46 | $ - s -
2011004005 | TEEPLES KARL DANCY ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,103.96 | $ 9,900.00 | § 8,796.04
2011007005 _|JTS REAL ESTATE & TRUCKING INC ROSSIGNOL ST 31405 NO BID $ 2629.79 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 1 BLK DD TICKLEGIZZARD ROSSIGNOL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of PARRIS
2011010013 | NICK D, deceased ROSSIGNOL ST 31405 SHARON NORWOOD $ 1,103.93 | $ 4,100.00 | $ 2,996.07
In Rem against the property known as LOT 3 BLK DD TICKLEGIZZARD DEWIT ROSSIGNOL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
2011010014 | PARRIS NICK D, deceased ROSSIGNOL ST 31405 CHARLES ANTHONY GLOVER $ 1,103.96 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,896.04
In Rem against the property known as LOT 5 BLK DD TICKLEGIZZARD ROSSIGNOL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of PARRIS
2011010015 | NICK D, deceased ROSSIGNOL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,103.96 | $ - s -
2011010019 | CUMMINGS HECTOR JR ROSSIGNOL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,022.15 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as 24 BLK B B SHERWOOD TR TEMPLE ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of LONON CARRIE L,
2011011002 | deceased TEMPLE ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,103.96 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 1,396.04
In Rem against the property known as 17 BLK BB TICKLEGIZZARD 5107 DANCY ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of HARRIS
2011011046 | ELLIOTT, deceased 5107 DANCY ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,103.96 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 5,396.04
In Rem against the property known as LOT 13 BLOCK N HENRY WAYNE TRACT 0 STALEY AVE 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
2011110006 | LOADHOLT ANDREW, deceased O STALEY AVE 31405 HENRIETTA HILLS $ 1,082.07 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 2,717.93
2011114019 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* GLATIGNY ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC $ 1,262.32 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 1,937.68
In Rem against the property known as N PT TOF LOT 12 BLK G MARY A GODSELLS ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of GASTON
2012902002 | OLSTEAD, deceased GODSELLS ST 31405 SHARON NORWOOD $ 97835 | § 97835 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 13 BLOCK J TATEMVILLE DEWITT 717 TATEM ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
2014008017 _|ROBINSON CO THE, deceased 717 TATEM ST 31405 LESTOR GILKES $ 1,692.98 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 5,807.02
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 1 AND 2 HOPKINS PLACE CLINCH ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of WILLIAMS BEN
2055504004 | & LILLIE MAE, deceased CLINCH ST 31405 HENRIETTA HILLS $ 2,03845 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 1,361.55
2056303076 |JONES RUTH B 313 INGLEWOOD DR 31406 AHTE 6, LLC s 1,037.50 | $ 72,000.00 [ $ 70,962.50
2059103005 |RAY STEVEN JR & MAUREEN MARION ST 31405 LISA THOMPSON $ 2,065.52 | $ 2,065.52 | $ -
2059214002 _|In Rem against the property known as LT 9 BLK 12 MILTON AVE 31405, said property being formerly in the name of BROWN EUGENE, deceased | MILTON AVE 31405 JULIA M SPENCER $ 913.06 | § 913.06 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LTS 36 37 + 38 BLK TWIGGS ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of BURGIO & BLACKMON
20592 19006 | CHUCK & WARREN, deceased TWIGGS ST 31405 PHILLIP FERREBEE $ 1,724.61 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 47539
20592 20007 | WILLIAMS LEROY E TWIGGS ST 31405 FRANK AND IRENE HINES s 913.06 | 3,200.00 | § 2,286.94
20592 20009 | CARVER STATE BANK TWIGGS ST 31405 NO BID $ 913.06 | § - s -
2059220010 | CARVER STATE BANK TWIGGS ST 31405 JUDE BLASSINGALE s 913.06 [ 2,800.00 | § 1,886.94
2059220011 | SINGLETON CHRIS & MONICA TWIGGS ST 31405 NO BID $ 913.06 | § - s -
2059220012 | CARVER STATE BANK TWIGGS ST 31405 JUDE BLASSINGALE s 913.06 [ § 3,000.00 | § 2,086.94
2059302009 | MT TABOR MISSIONARY BAPTIST CHURCH CARROLL ST 31405 PHILLIP FERREBEE $ 98522 | § 2,000.00 | $ 1,014.78
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 1, 3, 5 BLK'S NORTH WARD CARROLL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of MCGRATH
2059307001 | & GOUBEAUD LAWRENCE F, deceased CARROLL ST 31405 NO BID $ 2,602.17 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 7 & 9 BLK'S NORTH WD WHATLE CARROLL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
2059307002 | ULMER HATTIE B, deceased CARROLL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,179.13 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 10 & 12 BLK S NORTH WD FAYETTE ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of ULMER
2059307008 | HATTIE B, deceased FAYETTE ST 31405 SHARON NORWOOD $ 117913 | $ 117913 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 20 BLOCK R NORTH WARD WHATLE CARROLL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of T8S
2059308008 | INVESTMENTS. CARROLL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,338.26 | $ - s -
2059309011 | BROWN SHARMAINE P CARROLL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,214.25 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 4 & 6 BLK G SOUTH WD WHATLE CARROLL ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
2059309012 | WILSON LAWRENCE F, deceased CARROLL ST 31405 NO BID $ 1,214.25 | $ S -
In Rem against the property known as LT 2 BLK A SOUTHOVER S WD 40 X 1 FAYETTE ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of HANLY
20593 10016 | BRIDGET EST OF, deceased FAYETTE ST 31405 PHILLIP FERREBEE $ 1,339.40 | $ 1,339.40 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LT 19 BLK U SOUTH WD WHATLEY SUB WALTON ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
20593 13007 | MCDONALD EVELYN LOVETT, deceased WALTON ST 31405 AHTE 6, LLC $ 1,339.40 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 2,660.60
2050313011 | BEACH OAK LLC OGLETHORPE ST 31405 JUDE BLASSINGALE $ 1,067.27 | $ 1,067.27 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LT 14 BLK C HOPKINS PLACE 1104 WALTER ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of JAMES
2059324004 | SAMUEL N & DIANA, deceased 1104 WALTER ST 31405 ATHENE INVESTMENTS, LP $ 1,720.27 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 1,779.73
In Rem against the property known as 13 OGEECHEE HGTS DAWES AVE 31405, said property being formerly in the name of BARNES HOWARD C &
2059507011 | FLORIA B, deceased DAWES AVE 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 97572 | § 1,200.00 | $ 224.28
In Rem against the property known as 14 15 OGEECHEE HGTS 3013 DAWES AVE 31405, said property being formerly in the name of BARNES.
2059507012 | HOWARD C & FLORIA B, deceased 3013 DAWES AVE 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,458.30 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 2,241.70
20596 01006 |JONES SMITH JULIA LAW ST 31405 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 97572 [ § 4,100.00 [ $ 3,124.28
2059605002 _|JOHNSON OPOLLP RAY COOPER AVE 31405 PHILLIP FERREBEE $ 97572 [ § 97572 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as SOUTH PART OF LOT 31 AND SOUTH P 38 ALBION ST 31408, said property being formerly in the name of
2062701007 | HEYWARD MARIE E, deceased 38 ALBION ST 31408 LESTOR GILKES $ 2,075.62 | $ 2,075.62 | $ -
2062807004 | DAVIS & MCBRIDE WILLIEJR & ALFRED ST 31408 CHATHAM COUNTY / CITY OF SAVANNAH LAND BANK AUTHORITY INC s 1,984.58 | $ 14,500.00 [ $ 12,515.42
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 31 AND 32 BLOCK A OGEECHEET JULIA LAW ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
20636 17002 | FIRST UNION FINANCIAL CORP. JULIA LAW ST 31405 WILLIAM SMITH $ 987.28 | $ 987.28 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 17 AND 18 BLOCK A OGEECHEET JULIA LAW ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of
20636 17007 | WOODS IRENE GRAY, deceased JULIA LAW ST 31405 WILLIAM SMITH $ 988.26 | $ 988.26 | $ -
20640 15003 | HERBST DAVID 4212 COLUMBIA AVE 31405 DIANN SCOTT $ 1,571.05 | $ 1,571.05 | $ -
2064301011 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* LYNES PKWY 31405 NO BID $ 2,162.81 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOTS 57 AND 58 TUSKEEGEE PARK TUSKEGEE ST 31405, said property being formerly in the name of DAVIS
2070604016 | MIKELL DEVELOPERS LLC. TUSKEGEE ST 31405 AHTE 6, LLC $ 1,176.67 | $ 8,900.00 | $ 772333
2071502005 | KENNEDY MALYNDA DARLING ST 31408 NO BID $ 1,120.59 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as EAST ONE HALF OF LOT 24 BLOCK 1 DARLING ST 31408, said property being formerly in the name of MCNEIL
2071502013 | WILLIE JAMES, deceased DARLING ST 31408 NO BID $ 1,267.43 | $ - s -
2071502040 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* 165 DARLING ST 31408 ANDRELL FIELDS s 1,854.63 | $ 1,854.63 | $ -
2071602002 | KENNEDY MALYNDA ROBERTS ST 31408 NO BID $ 1,943.98 | $ - s -
2071704006 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* 33 ALBION ST 31408 NO BID $ 2,093.98 | $ - s -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 14 BLK 7 WOODVILLE SUB  ALBION ST 31408, said property being formerly in the name of PATTERSON
2071705008 | JOHNNIE MAE, deceased ALBION ST 31408 DENNIS GRAYSON $ 2,093.98 | $ 2,093.98 | $ -




In Rem against the property known as COMMON AREA SOUTHERN WOODS MARSH TERREL MILL RD 31419, said property being formerly in the

2100301005 | name of SOUTHERN WOODS DEVELOPMENT LLC. TERREL MILL RD 31419 ROBERT ERIC PHILLIPS 3,791.50 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 13,208.50
2101602075 | NORTH GODLEY DEVELOPERS INC BENTON BLVD 31407 NO BID 7,813.45 | $ - Is -
In Rem against the property known as LOT 29 RESUB 76 79 IND CITY 153 VARNEDOE AVE 31408, said property being formerly in the name of
6000803017 | SMOAK KATHERINE B, deceased 153 VARNEDOE AVE 31408 AHTE 6, LLC 8237.77 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 3,262.23
In Rem against the property known as 41 SUB 20 NO PT 21 OF LEON VILLAGE RD 31408, said property being formerly in the name of KITCHENS
6001602002 | WILLIAM & DOROTHY JAC, deceased LEON VILLAGE RD 31408 CRAIG WILLSON 1,709.16 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 290.84
6002203029 | HILL COURTNEY K AGENT* DAVIS AVE 31408 NO BID 2,21877 [ $ - |s -
In Rem against the property known as PT OF LT 11 HAPPY 0 PRISCILLA D. THOMAS WAY 31408, said property being formerly in the name of JENKINS
6082002001 | WILLIE, deceased 0 PRISCILLA D. THOMAS WAY 31408 NO BID 435864 | S - 1 -
6082002009 | BECK THOMAS 0 PRISCILLA D. THOMAS WAY 31408 NO BID 4,764.63 | § - Is -
In Rem against the property known as TCT 80 X 91 BONNYBRIDGE ROAD & BONNYBRIDGE RD 31407, said property being formerly in the name of
70008 03006 | USHER JAMES B, deceased BONNYBRIDGE RD 31407 IAN HAMILTON 92429 | § 92429 | $ -
In Rem against the property known as LT E OF THE ALICE GORDON SHEAROU  US HIGHWAY 80 31302, said property being formerly in the name of
80010E01004 | BLACKSTOCK MARTHA S, deceased US HIGHWAY 80 31302 LEWIS ELI MITCHELL 2314.25 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 685.75
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