
Item SECTION A:  WEAPONS TO BE PURCHASED Qty. Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing 

1

SMITH & WESSON M&P 2.0 9MM 

SKU: 13353 

FACTORY CUT FOR AIMPOINT ACRO P2 WITH BLACKED OUT 

SIGHTS, LOWER 1/3 CO WITNESSED

70  $              509.00  $            35,630.00  NO BID  $                           -    $             497.52  $            34,826.40  $             425.00  $            29,750.00 

35,630.00$             $                           -   34,826.40$            29,750.00$            

Item SECTION B:  CREDIT FOR WEAPONS TO BE TRADED-IN Qty. Per Unit Credit Extended Credit Per Unit Credit Extended Credit Per Unit Credit Extended Credit Per Unit Credit Extended Credit

1
SMITH AND WESSON M&P 2.0 4.25 MOS

WITH 1 MAGAZINE and NO BOX
10 250.00$              2,500.00$               NO BID -$                        200.00$             2,000.00$              175.00$             1,750.00$               

2
SMITH AND WESSON M&P 2.0 5.00 MOS 

WITH 1 MAGAZINE AND NO BOX
14 250.00$              3,500.00$               NO BID -$                        210.00$             2,940.00$              250.00$             3,500.00$               

3 FN 509 PISTOLS WITH 2 MAGAZINES 5 200.00$              1,000.00$               NO BID -$                        210.00$             1,050.00$              300.00$             1,500.00$               

4 Glock 17 GEN 5 WITH 3 MAGAZINES and NO BOX  21 300.00$              6,300.00$               NO BID -$                        250.00$             5,250.00$              300.00$             6,300.00$               

5 Glock 17 GEN 5 MOS WITH 3 MAGAZINES and NO BOX 8 300.00$              2,400.00$               NO BID -$                        270.00$             2,160.00$              375.00$             3,000.00$               

15,700.00$            -$                        13,400.00$            16,050.00$            

Item SECTION C:  ACCESSORIES TO BE PURCHASED Qty. Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing Per Unit Price Extended Pricing

1

SAFARILAND 6390RDS-2222-131 

RIGHT HAND HOLSTERS WITH QDS INSTALLED ON EACH 

HOLSTER

70 NO BID -$                         121.65$             8,515.50$              -$                        159.00$             11,130.00$            

2

SAFARILAND 6390RDS-2222-132 

LEFT HAND HOLSTERS WITH QDS INSTALLED ON EACH 

HOLSTER

30 NO BID -$                         121.65$             3,649.50$              -$                        159.00$             4,770.00$               

3 STREAMLIGHT TLR1 WEAPON MOUNTED FLASHLIGHTS 80 NO BID -$                         135.21$             10,816.80$            117.16$             9,372.80$              120.00$             9,600.00$               

4 C&H PRECISION DUTY XL OPTIC RED 50 NO BID -$                         337.70$             16,885.00$            321.73$             16,086.50$            319.00$             15,950.00$            

5 C&H PRECISION DUTY XL OPTIC GREEN 25 NO BID -$                         337.70$             8,442.50$              321.73$             8,043.25$              319.00$             7,975.00$               

-$                         48,309.30$            33,502.55$            49,425.00$            

Acknowledgement of Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes Yes

19,930.00$            48,309.30$            54,928.95$            63,125.00$            

G T Distributors, Inc.                                      

Pflugerville, TX

Clyde Armory, Inc.                                                    

Athens, GA

Gulf States Distributors, Inc.                                     

Montgomery, AL

GRAND TOTAL  (A), (B), (C) =

SECTION (B) TRADE-IN CREDIT TOTAL   = 

 SECTION (C) TOTAL  = 

 SECTION (A) GRAND TOTAL = 

*ANY ALTERATION OR DUPLICATION OF THE BID SHEET SHALL BE CAUSE FOR DISQUALIFICATION OF BID SUBMISSION.  ANY 

QUESTIONS REGARDING THE BID SHEET SHALL BE DIRECTED TO THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.   

BID 24-0084-4 Weapons and Accessories Purchase with Trade-Ins 

for CCSO                                                                                        BID DUE: 

SSD International, Inc.                                                                             

Apopka, FL


