
**CKC/Facility 
Care         

Savannah, GA

**Tribond
Milton, GA

# Items QTY Req. UOM  UnitPrice  TotalCost  UnitPrice  TotalCost
Unit
Price

 TotalCost  UnitPrice  TotalCost

#0-1
Janitorial Services for the 
Administrative Annex as 

specified
12 Months $6,300.00 $75,600.00 $2,600.00 $31,200.00 $6,500.00 $78,000.00 $18,300.00 $219,600.00

#0-2
Janitorial Services for the E911 

trailer as specified
12 Months No Bid No Bid $550 $6,600.00 $810 $9,720.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00

#0-3
Janitorial Services for Police 

Precinct #1
12 Months No Bid No Bid $6,075.00 $72,900.00 $7,691.66 $92,299.92 $52,304.00 $627,648.00

#0-4
Janitorial Services for Police 

Precinct #5
12 Months No Bid No Bid $1,900.00 $22,800.00 $2,166.00 $25,992.00 $20,160.00 $241,920.00

#0-5
Janitorial Services for Police 

Precinct #6
12 Months No Bid No Bid $1,900.00 $22,800.00 $2,166.00 $25,992.00 $20,160.00 $241,920.00

Acknowledgement of 
Addendum 1

Yes Yes Yes Yes

Total Cost
Non-Responisve - 

Did not attend 
mandatory pre-bid.

Non-Responisve - 
Did not attend 

mandatory pre-bid.

*MBE
**WBE

BID 24-0127-6 ANNUAL CONTRACT TO PROVIDE 
JANITORIAL SERVICES FOR THE ADMINISTRATIVE ANNEX, 

E911 TRAILER AND POLICE PRECINCTS 1,5 AND 6
BID DUE: NOVEMBER 4, 2024 @ 2PM

*Yo's Eco Services, LLC
Savannah, GA

$75,600.00 $232,003.92 $1,373,088.00$156,300.00

**Imagann Cleaning 
Service, Inc.
Lithonia, GA

**New Beginnings 
Commercial Residential 

Cleaning Plus, Inc.
Savannah, GA

**TnZ Cleaning Service, 
LLC

Port Wentworth, GA


