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#0-1
Cisco N9K-C93180YC-
FX3 – Nexus 9300 48p 

1/10/25g Switch
6 $10,251.00 $61,506.00 $9,993.28 $59,959.68 $10,049.99 $60,299.94 $11,071.08 $66,426.48 $10,470.43 $62,822.58 $10,972.61 $65,835.66

#0-2

CON-L14HR-
N9KC93X3 – CX Level 
1 24X7X4 for Nexus 

9300

6 $2,101.95 $12,611.70 $2,006.94 $12,041.64 $2,018.33 $12,109.98 $2,076.00 $12,456.00 $2,463.85 $14,783.10 $2,098.78 $12,592.68

#0-3

C1E1TN9300XF-3Y - 
Data Center 

Networking Essentials 
N9300 XF, 3 Year

6 $11,539.18 $69,235.08 $12,003.87 $72,023.22 $12,072.00 $72,432.00 $12,569.46 $75,416.76 $12,828.42 $76,970.52 $12,707.21 $76,243.26

#0-4
NXA-FAN-35CFM-PE – 

Nexus fan, 35CFM, 
Port Side Exhaust

16 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 No Bid No Bid $148.62 $2,377.92 $147.22 $2,355.52

#0-5
NXA-PAC-650W-PE – 
Nexus 650W PSU – 
Port Side Exhaust

8 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 No Bid No Bid $409.58 $3,276.64 $404.68 $3,237.44

#0-6
NXA-FAN-35CFM-PI – 

Nexus fan, 35CFM, 
Port Side Intake

8 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 No Bid No Bid $163.83 $1,310.64 $161.87 $1,294.96

#0-7
NXA-PAC-650W-PI – 
Nexus 650W PSU – 

Port Side Intake
4 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 No Bid No Bid $394.76 $1,579.04 $404.68 $1,618.72

Acknowledgement of 
Addendum 1

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Total Cost

BID 24-0152-6 PURCHASE OF 
CISCO NEXUS SWITCHES TO 

SUPPORT DATA CENTER 
CONNECTIONS (ARPA)                                                            

BID DUE: OCTOBER 10, 2024 @ 
2PM

*Netwaresecure                                                        
Alpharetta, GA

$144,024.54$143,352.78 $163,120.44 $163,178.24$144,841.92 $154,299.24

*IT Savvy                                                     
Oak Brook, IL

*Magna Cyber, LLC                                 
Pembroke Pines, FL

*Mvation Worldwide, 
Inc.                                                           

Glen Cove, NY                                                                        

*Axelliant, LLC                                                   
Torrance, CA

*DISYS Solutions, Inc.                                                                 
Ashburn, VA
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#0-1
Cisco N9K-C93180YC-
FX3 – Nexus 9300 48p 

1/10/25g Switch
6 $18,197.41 $109,184.46 $10,726.47 $64,358.82 $11,000.00 $66,000.00 $30,533.48 $183,200.88 $34,672.50 $208,035.00

#0-2

CON-L14HR-
N9KC93X3 – CX Level 
1 24X7X4 for Nexus 

9300

6 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,889.92 $35,339.52 $2,200.00 $13,200.00 $2,828.55 $16,971.30 $2,984.25 $17,905.50

#0-3

C1E1TN9300XF-3Y - 
Data Center 

Networking Essentials 
N9300 XF, 3 Year

6 $9,000.00 $54,000.00 $12,621.25 $75,727.50 $13,940.00 $83,640.00 $22,460.19 $134,761.14 $23,696.53 $142,179.18

#0-4
NXA-FAN-35CFM-PE – 

Nexus fan, 35CFM, 
Port Side Exhaust

16 $0 $0 $0 $0 $500 $8,000.00 $260.22 $4,163.52 $0 $0

#0-5
NXA-PAC-650W-PE – 
Nexus 650W PSU – 
Port Side Exhaust

8 $0 $0 $0 $0 $500 $4,000.00 $715.26 $5,722.08 $0 $0

#0-6
NXA-FAN-35CFM-PI – 

Nexus fan, 35CFM, 
Port Side Intake

8 $0 $0 $0 $0 $500 $4,000.00 $286.10 $2,288.80 $0 $0

#0-7
NXA-PAC-650W-PI – 
Nexus 650W PSU – 

Port Side Intake
4 $0 $0 $0 $0 $500 $2,000.00 $715.26 $2,861.04 $0 $0

Acknowledgement of 
Addendum 1

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Total Cost
*MBE

**WBE

$368,119.68$175,184.46 $175,425.84 $180,840.00 $349,968.76

*CDW Government, LLC                                             
Vernon Hills, IL

**AlxTel, Inc.                                                 
Silver Spring, MD

Logical Resources Group, 
LLC                                           

Columbia, MD

*G5 Business Solutions, 
LLC                                                                         

Richmond Hill, GA

*JJT & Associates, LLC                                           
Atlanta, GA


