

**BID 26-0089-2 ANNUAL CONTRACT TO PROVIDE LOW
VOLTAGE CABLING SERVICES FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
OF CHATHAM COUNTY
BID DUE: AUGUST 11, 2026 @ 2PM**

				**scDataCom, LLC Savannah, GA		NetPlanner Systems, Inc. Savannah, GA		Premier Networx Augusta, GA		**Remote Technology Security Services, LLC Savannah, GA		All Electric Company, Inc. Savannah, GA	
#	Items	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost
#0-1	Single Plenum Outlet (150' or Less)	1	Lump Sum per Outlet	\$375	\$375	\$500	\$500	\$345	\$345	\$766	\$766	\$490	\$490
#0-2	Dual Plenum Outlet (150' or Less)	1	Lump Sum per Outlet	\$640	\$640	\$700	\$700	\$585	\$585	\$932	\$932	\$825	\$825
#0-3	Single Plenum Outlet (150' or More)	1	Lump Sum per Outlet	\$549	\$549	\$680	\$680	\$450	\$450	\$1,461.00	\$1,461.00	\$540	\$540
#0-4	Dual Plenum Outlet (150' or More)	1	Lump Sum per Outlet	\$715	\$715	\$935	\$935	\$725	\$725	\$1,756.00	\$1,756.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
#0-5	3/4" Electrical Grade PVC Conduit Installation	500	Per Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.25	\$1,125.00	\$3.60	\$1,800.00	\$280	\$140,000.00
	Acknowledgement of Addendums No. 1-2			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
	Total Cost			\$2,279.00		\$2,815.00		\$3,230.00		\$6,715.00		\$142,855.00	

**WBE