
BID 23-0053-6      ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL FOR CHATHAM

                             COUNTY AND OTHER VARIOUS AGENCIES

BID DUE: MAY 9, 2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

REGULAR WORKING 

HOURS (Monday-

Friday)

Sommers Oil 

Company        

Richmond Hill, 

GA

Saratoga Rack 

Marketing, 

LLC                    

Houston, TX

**James River 

Solutions, LLC              

Ashland, VA

REGULAR WORKING 

HOURS (Monday-

Friday)

Colonial Oil 

Industries, 

Inc.                 

Savannah, GA

Sunoco, LP    

Dallas, TX

*Atlantic 

Petroleum & 

Mineral 

Resources, Inc.           

Houston, TX

Tank Wagon Deliveries 

(Up to Approx. Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Tank Wagon Deliveries 

(Up to Approx. Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Unleaded Regular 

(90,100 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.02 0.12

Unleaded Regular (90,100 

Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 2.7032 0.002 0.434

Unleaded Premium 

(28,000 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.02 0.12

Unleaded Premium 

(28,000 Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 3.4171 0.002 0.434

Bio Diesel Fuel (163,520 

Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.02 0.12

Bio Diesel Fuel (163,520 

Gallons)
0 0.2651 0.2651 0 0.3 0.3 2.7319 0.002 0.434

Bio Diesel Fuel - Red 

(32,000 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.04 0.14

Bio Diesel Fuel - Red 

(32,000 Gallons)
0 0.2701 0.2701 0 0.3 0.3 2.7244 0.002 0.434

Ethanol Free 89 Octane                           

(2,500 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.04 0.14

Ethanol Free 89 Octane                           

(2,500 Gallons)
0 0.2651 0.2651 0 0.3 0.3 3.304 0.002 0.434

Tansport Loads (8,000 

to 8,500 Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Tansport Loads (8,000 

to 8,500 Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Unleaded Regular 

(1,633,739 Gallons)
0.015 (-).0190 (-).0040 0.024 -0.033 -0.009 0.0015 0.001 0.0025

Unleaded Regular 

(1,633,739 Gallons)
0 0.0207 0.0207 0 -0.02 -0.02 2.7032 0.002 0.0857

Bio Diesel Fuel 

(2,100,960 Gallons)
0.015 (-).0352 (-).0202 0.0281 -0.0415 -0.0134 0.004 0.001 0.005

Bio Diesel Fuel 

(2,100,960 Gallons)
0 0.0267 0.0267 0 -0.04 -0.04 2.7319 0.002 0.0857

SPECIAL RATES 

(AFTER NORMAL 

WORKING HOURS / 

WEEKENDS)

Sommers Oil 

Company        

Richmond Hill, 

GA

Saratoga Rack 

Marketing, 

LLC                    

Houston, TX

**James River 

Solutions, LLC              

Ashland, VA

SPECIAL RATES 

(AFTER NORMAL 

WORKING HOURS / 

WEEKENDS)

Colonial Oil 

Industries, 

Inc.                 

Savannah, GA

Sunoco, LP    

Dallas, TX

*Atlantic 

Petroleum & 

Mineral 

Resources, Inc.           

Houston, TX

Tank Wagon Deliveries 

(Up to Approx. Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Tank Wagon Deliveries 

(Up to Approx. Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Unleaded Regular                            

(92,600 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.13 0.23

Unleaded Regular                            

(92,600 Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 2.7032 0.002 0.434

Unleaded Premium                   

(28,000 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.13 0.23

Unleaded Premium                   

(28,000 Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 3.4171 0.002 0.434

Bio Diesel Fuel                      

(165,520 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.13 0.23

Bio Diesel Fuel                      

(165,520 Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 2.7319 0.002 0.434

Bio Diesel Fuel - Red                      

(32,000 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.15 0.25

Bio Diesel Fuel - Red                      

(32,000 Gallons)
0 0.2601 0.2601 0 0.3 0.3 2.7244 0.002 0.434

Ethanol Free 89 Octane                                         

(2,500 Gallons)
no bid no bid no bid No Bid 0.1 0.15 0.25

Ethanol Free 89 Octane                                         

(2,500 Gallons)
0 0.2561 0.2561 0 0.3 0.3 3.304 0.002 0.434

Tansport Loads (8,000 

to 8,500 Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Tansport Loads (8,000 

to 8,500 Gallons)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                    

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

C                  

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

A         

Freight 

Charge 

($Gallon)

B          

Overhead 

Difference 

($Gallon)

   C                 

Total Mark-Up 

($Gallon)

Unleaded Regular                  

(1,633,739 Gallons)
0.015 (-).0190 (-).0040 0.024 -0.033 -0.009 0.0015 0.0035 0.005

Unleaded Regular                  

(1,633,739 Gallons)
0 0.0207 0.0207 0 -0.02 -0.02 2.7032 0.002 0.2857

Bio Diesel Fuel                        

(2,100,960 Gallons)
0.015 (-).0352 (-).0202 0.0281 -0.0415 -0.0134 0.004 0.0035 0.0075

Bio Diesel Fuel                        

(2,100,960 Gallons)
0 0.0267 0.0267 0 -0.04 -0.04 2.7319 0.002 0.2857

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 HR 

Period

Delivery  Will Be 

Within (Hours of 

Request)

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 

HR Period

Delivery  Will 

Be Within 

(Hours of 

Request)

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 HR 

Period

Delivery  Will 

Be Within 

(Hours of 

Request)

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 

HR Period

Delivery  Will 

Be Within 

(Hours of 

Request)

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 

HR Period

Delivery  Will 

Be Within 

(Hours of 

Request)

Daily Rate 

Per Station 

/ Per 24 

HR Period

Delivery  Will Be 

Within (Hours of 

Request)

Disaster Relief (City of 

Savannah and Chatham 

County): Daily rate 

stationary diesel 

transport load trailer 

with transport tank 

wagon to remain on-

site.

no bid n/a Variable 24 $3,000.00 4

Disaster Relief (City of 

Savannah and Chatham 

County): Daily rate 

stationary diesel 

transport load trailer 

with transport tank 

wagon to remain on-

site.

$3,000 8 $5,000 24 $2,000.00 24-36

Acknowledge 

Addendums 1 & 2
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

*MBE

**WBE


