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#0-1
Purchase for all Playground 

Equipment & Surfacing (as per 
specifications)

1 Lump Sum $26,089.95 $26,089.95 $23,850.00 $23,850.00 $25,695.98 $25,695.98 $27,195.86 $27,195.86 $22,447.55 $22,447.55 $70,860.00 $70,860.00

#0-2
Installation of all Playground 

Equipment & Surfacing (as per 
specifications)

1 Lump Sum $12,161.30 $12,161.30 $17,850.00 $17,850.00 $13,620.00 $13,620.00 $11,742.14 $11,742.14 $15,002.00 $15,002.00 $0 $0

#0-3
Alternate #1: Replacement of 

Existing Black Playground Border
1 Lump Sum $1,666.25 $1,666.25 No Bid No Bid $2,682.00 $2,682.00 $3,262.00 $3,262.00 $8,157.71 $8,157.71 No Bid No Bid

ACK. of Addendums 1-4 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Total Cost

BID 25-0149-2 WILMINGTON ISLAND PARK 
PLAYGROUND

BID DUE: DECEMBER 18, 2025 @ 2PM

Technology 
International, Inc.

Lake Mary, FL

$39,917.50 $41,997.98 $45,607.26$42,200.00$41,700.00 $70,860.00

Bliss Products and 
Services, Inc.

Lithia Springs, GA

Playcore Wisonsin, Inc. 
DBA Gametime
Fort Payne, AL

Lanier Plans, Inc. DBA 
KorKat

Carrollton, GA
Playworx Playsets, LLC

Canton, GA
Safe Play Solutions, LLC

Canton, GA


