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#0-1
Cisco C9500-48Y4C-A - Catalyst 9500 48-

Port with Advantage License
8 $16,037.08 $128,296.64 $17,008.15 $136,065.20 $17,071.22 $136,569.76 $16,989.00 $135,912.00 $17,000.00 $136,000.00 $17,382.96 $139,063.68 $15,636.16 $125,089.28 $18,184.91 $145,479.28

#0-2
Cisco C9k-PWR-650WAC-R - Secondary 

power supply for C9500 Switch
8 $1,491.42 $11,931.36 $1,581.73 $12,653.84 $1,595.00 $12,760.00 $1,519.00 $12,152.00 $1,600.00 $12,800.00 $1,616.59 $12,932.72 $1,454.13 $11,633.04 $1,691.17 $13,529.36

#0-3
CON-SNTP-C9504YA4 - Smartnet 24x7x4 

Coverage for C9500 Switch
2 $2,626.40 $5,252.80 No Bid No Bid $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,539.00 $5,078.00 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $2,618.59 $5,237.18 $7,419.99 $14,839.98 $2,971.12 $5,942.24

#0-4
CON-SNT-C9504YA4 - Smartnet 8x5xNBD 

Coverage for C9500 Switch
6 $1,641.60 $9,849.60 No Bid No Bid $1,379.00 $8,274.00 $1,789.84 $10,739.04 $1,700.00 $10,200.00 $1,636.72 $9,820.32 $4,758.00 $28,548.00 $1,857.06 $11,142.36

#0-5
C9500-DNA-A-3Y - Cisco Catalyst DNA 

Advantage 3Y License
8 $8,015.23 $64,121.84 $8,500.56 $68,004.48 $8,540.00 $68,320.00 $8,427.91 $67,423.28 $8,500.00 $68,000.00 $8,687.89 $69,503.12 $9,017.14 $72,137.12 $9,088.70 $72,709.60

#0-6 Cisco SFP-25G-ER-I - 25G SFP28 Modules 12 $2,980.87 $35,770.44 $7,376.62 $88,519.44 $7,410.00 $88,920.00 $7,399.87 $88,798.44 $7,300.00 $87,600.00 $7,539.08 $90,468.96 $7,724.78 $92,697.36 $7,886.89 $94,642.68

#0-7
Cisco SFP-10/25G-LR-S - 10/25G SFP28 

Modules
4 $665.81 $2,663.24 $999.84 $3,999.36 $1,060.00 $4,240.00 $943.37 $3,773.48 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $1,043.75 $4,175.00 $1,077.77 $4,311.08 $1,652.49 $6,609.96
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#0-1
Cisco C9500-48Y4C-A - Catalyst 9500 48-

Port with Advantage License
8 $17,848.04 $142,784.32 $18,342.41 $146,739.28 $17,403.11 $139,224.88 $18,914.39 $151,315.12 $18,181.53 $145,452.24 $19,231.62 $153,852.96 $23,352.59 $186,820.72 $18,184.91 $145,479.28

#0-2
Cisco C9k-PWR-650WAC-R - Secondary 

power supply for C9500 Switch
8 $0 $0 $1,775.72 $14,205.76 $1,508.52 $12,068.16 $1,759.06 $14,072.48 $1,690.85 $13,526.80 No Bid No Bid $1,716.32 $13,730.56 $1,704.48 $13,635.84

#0-3
CON-SNTP-C9504YA4 - Smartnet 24x7x4 

Coverage for C9500 Switch
2 $7,424.07 $14,848.14 $3,119.67 $6,239.34 $7,365.90 $14,731.80 $2,855.05 $5,710.10 $7,720.24 $15,440.48 $8,166.60 $16,333.20 $2,808.79 $5,617.58 $7,435.24 $14,870.48

#0-4
CON-SNT-C9504YA4 - Smartnet 8x5xNBD 

Coverage for C9500 Switch
6 $4,640.33 $27,841.98 $1,949.91 $11,699.46 $4,603.97 $27,623.82 $1,784.44 $10,706.64 $4,825.43 $28,952.58 $5,104.43 $30,626.58 $1,755.60 $10,533.60 $7,435.24 $44,611.44

#0-5
C9500-DNA-A-3Y - Cisco Catalyst DNA 

Advantage 3Y License
8 $8,738.41 $69,907.28 $9,167.42 $73,339.36 $8,697.96 $69,583.68 $9,453.58 $75,628.64 $9,087.00 $72,696.00 $9,611.83 $76,894.64 $9,223.88 $73,791.04 $9,088.70 $72,709.60

#0-6 Cisco SFP-25G-ER-I - 25G SFP28 Modules 12 $7,582.92 $90,995.04 $8,281.23 $99,374.76 $7,547.81 $90,573.72 $8,203.52 $98,442.24 $7,885.42 $94,625.04 $8,340.85 $100,090.20 $8,004.19 $96,050.28 $7,948.99 $95,387.88

#0-7
Cisco SFP-10/25G-LR-S - 10/25G SFP28 

Modules
4 $1,693.72 $6,774.88 $1,106.64 $4,426.56 $1,581.44 $6,325.76 $1,129.94 $4,519.76 $1,062.84 $4,251.36 $1,124.21 $4,496.84 $1,140.50 $4,562.00 $1,119.01 $4,476.04
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*MBE
**WBE

$382,580.32 $391,399.74 $391,485.80

BID 25-0115-6 PURCHASE OF CISCO SWITCHES & 
HARDWARE

BID DUE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 @ 2PM

Kronosoft
Blythe, GA

BlueAlly Technology 
Solutions, LLC

Atlanta, GA

Netverta, LLC
Coral Springs, FL

$353,690.06 $356,294.94 $360,599.06 $360,686.20 $375,214.78

Lockstep Technology 
Group

Peachtree Corners, GA

*JPT-TECH, LLC
Micanpoy, FL

JKS Systems
Glastonbury, CT

Jaak Technologies, LLC
Calverton, MD

Bluum USA, Inc.
Phoenix, AZ

$331,470.82

*vCloud Tech, Inc. 
Rolling Hills Estate, CA

$349,487.36$324,134.24 $325,100.00 $350,543.72$258,097.58 $323,757.74$309,497.48

Softchoice Corporation
Chicago, IL

*Unicom Government
Chantilly, VA

**Civic Tech, LLC
El Prado, NM

*DISYS SOLUTIONS, Inc.
Ashburn, VA

Bay Pointe Technology, 
LTD

Medina, OH

Black Marlin, LLC
West Des Moines, IA

CDW Government, LLC
Vernon Hills, IL


