
RFQ 21-0096-5 PURCHASE OF NITRILE GLOVES

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

Quintero
Enterprises

Ridgewood, NY

TOTAL

s3,665

$7,330

$7,330

$7,330

s1,466

1-2 Weeks

$27,121

LINIT
PRICE

$73.30

$73.30

$73.30

s73.30

$73.30

MFG

Nacosa

Nacosa

Nacosa

Nacosa

Nacosa

Lainiere Health,
Inc.

New York, NY

TOTAL

$o

$4,000

$4,000

s0

$0

Immediate

$8,000

UNIT
PRICE

$40

$40

MFG.

Lainiere
Health

Lainiere
Health

Interboro
Packaging

Montgomerv, NY

TOTAL

$900

$ 1,800

$1,800

$1,800

$960

3-7 Days

$7,260

LINIT
PRICE

$18

$18

$18

$18

$48

MFG

Supermax /
Safeko

Aurelia

Supermax /
Safeko

Aurelia

Supermax /
Safeko

Aurelia

Supermax /
Safeko

Aurelia

Supermax /
Safeko

Aurelia

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mi1,
100/box (case)

Delivery

BID TOTAL

ITEM

1

2

J

4

5

Page 1



RFQ 21-0096-s PI]RCHASE OF NITzuLE GLOVES

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

Cedar Promo
Hinsdale,IL

TOTAL

$4,490

$8,980

s8,980

$8,980

$1,796

3-7 Days

$33,226

LINIT
PRICE

$89.80

$89.80

$89.80

s89.80

$89.80

MFG

Rhino

Rhino

Rhino

Rhino

Rhino

Vertex Packaging
Supplies

Sante Fe Springs,
CA

TOTAL

s4,250

$8,500

$8,500

$8,500

s1,700

3 Days

$31,450

LTNIT

PRICE

$8s

s8s

$8s

$8s

$8s

MFG

Gallant

Gallant

Gallant

Direct
Safety

Direct
Safety

Frontline Group,

LLC
Blacklick, OH

TOTAL

$4,250

$6,900

$6,900

$6,900

s3,400

3 Days

$28,350

UNIT
PRICE

$85

$6e

$6e

$69

$1 70

MFG

Careplus

Pure Glove

Pure Glove

AMST

Prosafe

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

ITEM

1

2

J

4

5

Page 2



RFQ 21-0096-s

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

PURCHASE OF NITRILE GLOVES

GP Trading
Partners

Los Angeles, CA

TOTAL

$5,000.00

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

$2,400.00

14 Days

s37,400

LINIT
PRICE

$100

$100

$100

s100

$120

MFG

Aplus

Aplus

Aplus

Aplus

Aplus

STSC Clinical
Duluth, GA

TOTAL

$5,000

$10,000

$10,000

$10,000

s2,000

2 Weeks

s37,000

L]NIT
PRICE

s100

$100

$100

$100

s100

MFG

Cleanguard

Cleanguard

Cleanguard

Cleanguard

Cleanguard

Rhino Medical
Supply,Inc.

Columbia, SC

TOTAL

$5,250

$ 10,500

$10,500

$10,500

$o

2-3 Days

$36,750

UNIT
PzuCE

$10s

$10s

$10s

$l 0s

MFG

Ammex
Corp

Ammex
Corp

Ammex
Corp

Ammex
Corp

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC.

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

MediumNitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

ITEM

I

2

J

4

5

Page 3



RFQ 21-0096-s

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

PURCHASE OF NITRILE GLOVES

Unipak Corp.

Brooklyn, NY

TOTAL

$5,850

$1 1,700

$11,700

$11,700

$0

s44,206
s40,950

UNIT
PzuCE

$117

$117

$117

$117

MFG

UPC

UPC

UPC

UPC

INV Tech Services,

LLC
Rosewell, GA

TOTAL

$5,450

$10,900

$10,900

$10,900

$0

>/: 45 Days

$38,150

UNIT
PRICE

s109

s109

s10e

$109

MFG

INTCO
Advancare

INTCO
Advancare

INTCO
Advancare

INTCO
Advancare

All In Safety Corp.

Brooklyn, NY

TOTAL

$5,450

$10,800

$10,800

s10,800

$0

2Days

$37,850

LINIT
PRICE

$109

$1 08

$1 08

$1 08

MFG

Xpose
Safety

Xpose

Safety

Xpose
Safety

Xpose
Safety

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

ITEM

I

2

J

4

5
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RFQ 21-0096-s PURCHASE OF NITRILE GLOVES

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

Medical Supplies
Co.

Lexington, KY

TOTAL

$6,400

$12,800

$12,800

$12,800

$2,560

7 Days

$47,360

UNIT
PRICE

$128

$128

$128

s128

$128

MFG

Safeko

Safeko

Safeko

Safeko

Safeko

Wurth Wood
Group,Inc.

Charlotte, NC

TOTAL

$5,800

$11,600

$11,600

$11,600

$3, 034

30 Days

s43,634

UNIT
PRICE

s1 16

$116

$116

s1 l6

$1 s2

MFG.

Prince

Prince

Prince

Prince

Wurth

Bizcon Consulting
Council Bluffs,IA

TOTAL

$5,975.00

$11,950.00

sl1,950.00

$11,950.00

No Bid

7-10 Days

s41,825

LTNIT

PRICE

$119.s0

$1 19.50

$119.s0

$l19.s0

No Bid

MFG

Precious
Mountain
Ent. Com.
Precious
Mountain
Ent. Corp.
Precious
Mountain
Ent. Corp.
Precious

Mountain
Ent. Com.
Precious
Mountain
Ent. Corp.

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mi1,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

ITEM

1

2

a
J

4

5
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RFQ 21-0096-5 PURCHASE OF MTRILE GLOVES

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

MSC Industrial
Supply Co.

Mableton, GA

TOTAL

$9,405

$18,810

$18,810

$18,810

No Quote

1-2 Days

$65,835

TINIT
PRICE

$1 88

$1 88

$1 88

s1 88

No

Quote

MFG

Value

Value

Value

Value

iRemedy
Healthcare, Inc.

Stuard, FL

TOTAL

$7,498

$14,995

$14,995

$14,995

$0

3-5 Days

$52,483

UNIT
PRICE

$149.9s

$149.95

$149.95

$149.9s

MFG

Intco

Intco

Intco

Intco

Supreme Medical
Theodore, AL

TOTAL

$6,961

s13,922

$t3,922

$13,922

$2,784

5-7 Days

$51,51,1

TINIT
PRICE

$ 139.218

$l39.2r8

s 139.218

$ 139.218

$ 139.218

MFG

Vanguard

Vanguard

Vanguard

Vanguard

Vanguard

QTY

50

100

100

100

20

DESC.

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

ITEM

I

2

J

4

5
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RFQ 21-0096-s

BID DUE: AUGUST 4,2021@ 10AM

Procurement Specialist:

NITRILE GLO

$576,000

s155,000

$155,000

$33,500

2 Weeks

TOTAL

$77,500

$155,000

NOIZ Medical
Supplies, LLC

Hiram, GA

$17

$1s.sO

$1s.50

$1s.50

$15.50

UNIT
PRICE

NOlZ

NOlZ

MFG.

NOlZ

NOlZ

NOlZ

$90,000

No Bid

2 Weeks

$31

TOTAL

$45,000

$90,000

$90,000

Vastmed, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

$900

No Bid

$900

$900

$900

UNIT
PRICE

Vastmed

Vastmed

MFG

Vastmed

Vastmed100

100

100

20

QTY

50

Large Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

XL Nitrile Gloves,
4mil, 100/box

(case)

2XL Nitril
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

Delivery
BID TOTAL

DESC

Small Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/bx (case)

Medium Nitrile
Gloves,4mil,
100/box (case)

4

5

ITEM

1

2

J
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