BID 26-0003-2 PURCHASE OF KNOWBE4 SECUIRTY AWARENESS TRAINING AND

**International Cloud

Southern Computer

*vCloud Tech, Inc.

**Software
Information Resource

**National Tek

PHISHING PREVENTION SUBSCRIPTION FOR CHATHAM COUNTY Business, Inc. **AlxTel,Inc. Warehouse, Inc. IT Devices Online, Inc. | Rolling Hills Estates, Corp. Services, Inc.
BID DUE: JANUARY 30, 2026 @ 2PM Ashburn, VA Silver Spring, MD Marietta, GA Walnut Creek, CA CA Washington, DC Libertyville, IL
Manufacturer
Part Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
# Items Number QTY |UOM |Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-1 Subscription Diamond - Year 1 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $14.60 | $32,120.00 | $13.95 | $30,690.00 | $13.95 | $30,681.20 | $13.96 | $30,718.60 | $13.97 | $30,734.00 | $41.94 | $92,268.00 | $14.10 | $31,020.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 1 of |PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-2 3 F36-G 2200 |EACH | $6.60 | $14,520.00 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 | $6.24 | $13,728.00 | $6.25 | $13,742.52 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 | $18.76 | $41,272.00 | $6.30 | $13,860.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-3 Subscription Diamond - Year 2 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid $13.85 | $30,470.00 | $13.95 | $30,681.20 | $13.96 | $30,712.00 | $13.97 | $30,734.00 |No Bid |No Bid $14.10 | $31,020.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 2 of |PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-4 3 F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid $6.20 | $13,640.00 | $6.24 | $13,728.00 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 [No Bid |No Bid $6.30 | $13,860.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-5 Subscription Diamond - Year 3 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid $13.85 | $30,470.00 | $13.95 | $30,681.20 | $13.96 | $30,712.00 | $13.97 | $30,734.00 |No Bid |No Bid $14.10 | $31,020.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 3 of
#0-6 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid $6.20 | $13,640.00 | $6.24 | $13,728.00 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 | $6.25 | $13,750.00 [No Bid |No Bid $6.30 | $13,860.00
Delivery 1/2 Weeks 7 Days 1-5 Days 2-3 1-2 Days 1 Week
Acknowledgement of Addenums 1-2 Yes Yes | Yes Yes | Yes Yes | Yes |
Total Cost $46,640.00 $132,660.00 $133,227.60 $133,385.12 $133,452.00 $133,540.00 $134,640.00
BID 26-0003-2 PURCHASE OF KNOWBE4 SECUIRTY AWARENESS TRAINING AND **Federal Cyber BlueAlly Technology Archer Energy
PHISHING PREVENTION SUBSCRIPTION FOR CHATHAM COUNTY GovSmart, Inc. *vPrime Tech, Inc. Systems, LLC Solutions, LLC Natix, Inc. Solutions, LLC
BID DUE: JANUARY 30, 2026 @ 2PM Charlottesville, VA Houston, TX San Diego, CA Atlanta, GA Meadow Vista, CA Clackamas, OR
Manufacturer
Part Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
# Items Number QTY |UOM |Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-1 Subscription Diamond - Year 1 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $42.34 | $93,148.00 | $42.36 | $93,192.00 [ $14.20 | $31,240.00 | $14.20 | $31,240.00 | $14.21 | $31,262.00 | $14.27 | $31,394.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 1 of | PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-2 3 F36-G 2200 |EACH | $18.94 | $41,668.00 | $18.95 | $41,690.00 [ $6.35 $13,970.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.39 | $14,058.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-3 Subscription Diamond - Year 2 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $14.20 | $31,240.00 [ $14.20 | $31,240.00 | $14.21 | $31,262.00 | $14.27 | $31,394.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 2 of |PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-4 3 F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid No Bid [No Bid $6.35 | $13,970.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.38 | $14,036.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-5 Subscription Diamond - Year 3 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $14.20 | $31,240.00 [ $14.20 | $31,240.00 | $14.21 | $31,262.00 | $14.26 | $31,372.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 3 of
#0-6 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 [EACH [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $6.35 $13,970.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.36 | $13,992.00 | $6.38 | $14,036.00
Delivery 3 Days 2 Days 1-5 Days 24 hrs 2 Days 24 hrs
Acknowledgement of Addenums 1-2 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Total Cost $134,816.00 $134,882.00 $135,630.00 $135,696.00 $135,762.00 $136,290.00
**Computers At
BID 26-0003-2 PURCHASE OF KNOWBE4 SECUIRTY AWARENESS TRAINING AND Work! INC dba **SOUTHERNBELLE
PHISHING PREVENTION SUBSCRIPTION FOR CHATHAM COUNTY Sierra Experts Azuris Consulting Cyberfix, LLC *UNIQUE AGIILITY, LLC| *C3K Properties, LLC VTECHio ROOM, LLC
BID DUE: JANUARY 30, 2026 @ 2PM Pittsburgh, PA The Woodlands, TX Valdosta, GA Raleight, NC Cumming, GA Naples, FL Atlanta, GA
Manufacturer
Part Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
# Items Number QTY |UOM |Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-1 Subscription Diamond - Year 1 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $14.41 [ $31,694.52 | $14.98 | $32,956.00 | $47.68 | $104,896.00 $55 | $121,000.00 | $43.98 | $96,756.00 | $48.88 | $107,536.00 | $55.15 | $121,330.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 1 of |PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-2 3 F36-G 2200 |EACH | $6.45 | $14,190.00 | $6.70 | $14,740.00 | $21.33 | $46,926.00 $25 | $55,000.00 [ $19.89 | $43,758.00 | $21.87 | $48,114.00 | $23.49 | $51,678.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-3 Subscription Diamond - Year 2 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $14.41 | $31,702.00 | $14.98 | $32,956.00 [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $43.98 | $96,756.00 | $48.88 | $107,536.00 | $56.25 | $123,750.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 2 of |PHISHER PLUS-N-
#0-4 3 F36-G 2200 |EACH | $6.45 | $14,190.00 | $6.70 | $14,740.00 [No Bid |No Bid No Bid [No Bid $19.89 | $43,758.00 | $21.87 | $48,114.00 | $23.96 | $52,712.00
KnowBe4 Security Awareness Training
#0-5 Subscription Diamond - Year 3 of 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $14.41 | $31,702.00 | $14.98 | $32,956.00 [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid $43.98 | $96,756.00 | $48.88 | $107,536.00 | $57.38 | $126,236.00
KnowBe4 PhishER Plus Subscription - Year 3 of
#0-6 3 KSATD-N-F36-G 2200 |EACH | $6.45 | $14,190.00 | $6.70 | $14,740.00 [No Bid |No Bid No Bid [No Bid $19.89 | $43,758.00 | $21.87 | $48,114.00 | $24.44 | $53,768.00
Delivery 48 hrs 1-3 Days 1-3 Days 24 hrs 15 Days 48 hrs 3-5 Days
Acknowledgement of Addenums 1-2 Yes | Yes Yes Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes
Total Cost $137,668.52 $143,088.00 $151,822.00 $176,000.00 $421,542.00 $466,950.00 $529,474.00

*MBE
**WBE




