BID 22-0147-7 - INSTALL DRAINAGE PIPES AND
*Sandhill ALS Construction, |**E & D Contracting Services,

REPAIR DRAINAGE BASIN BOXES AT TWO (2) Inc Inc PINCO
LOCATIONS Port Wentvs;orth GA Savanna.h GA Garden City, GA
BID DUE: FEBRUARY 7, 2023 @ 2PM ! !
ITEM DESCRIPTION LOCATION QTY.|U/M]| UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Sq.
1 Remove/Replace concrete sidewalk 4” thick | 1 North Paxton Drive 16 Fc'l $100.00 $1,600.00 $118.00 $1,888.00 $270.00 $4,320.00
Grad d Install . 144 LF. Of 18" RCP
2 rade and install appx. ¢ 1 North Paxton Drive | 144 | LF | $75.00 $10,800.00 $188.00 | $27,072.00 $265.00 $38,160.00
(concrete pipe)
3 Remove and install mailbox 1 North Paxton Drive 1 LS $300.00 $300.00 $2,205.00 $2,205.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00
Install and compact approx. 144 LF of proper
4 | backfill. Grade for drainage to flow into inlet ] 1 North Paxton Drive | 144 | LF $50.00 $7,200.00 $34.00 $4,896.00 $150.00 $21,600.00
boxes
5 Install erosion control 1 North Paxton Drive | 144 | LF $4.00 $576.00 $11.00 $1,584.00 $20.00 $2,880.00
6 Traffic Control 1 North Paxton Drive 1 LS $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00
7 Install two (2) 18" drainage inlet boxes 1 North Paxton Drive 2 EA | $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $6,100.00 $12,200.00
8 Repair and seal existing basin boxes 1 North Paxton Drive 2 EA | $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $883.00 $1,766.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00
9 Clear existing path for pipe installation 15 Flinn Drive 240 | LF $50.00 $12,000.00 $15.00 $3,600.00 NO BID NO BID

Construct and install junction box to tie in
10 three (3) existing drainage pipes and 15 Flinn Drive 1 LS | $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 NO BID NO BID
proposed 36” HDPE pipe

Install 36” HDPE pipe following “Pipe

11 . . o, 15 Flinn Drive 240 | LF $300.00 $72,000.00 $288.00 $69,120.00 NO BID NO BID
Installation Typical Section
12 Install drainage inlet box for 15” RCP 15 Flinn Drive 1 LS | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 NO BID NO BID
13 Install drainage inlet box for 36” HDPE pipe 15 Flinn Drive 1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 NO BID NO BID
S| d 1 36” HDPE pi t 48” RCP
14 eeve and sea unctions pipe a 15 Flinn Drive 1 | s | $1,00000 | $1,00000 | $3,700.00 | $3,700.00 NO BID NO BID
15 Install 18' of 15" RCP 15 Flinn Drive 18 LF $100.00 $1,800.00 $132.00 $2,376.00 NO BID NO BID
Install and compact proper fill and erosion
16 | control. Grade for drainage to flow into inlet 15 Flinn Drive 240 | LF $125.00 $30,000.00 $44.00 $10,560.00 NO BID NO BID
boxes
Install ri t th end of d 36”
17 | MeEtrierapa s:[l)JPET)?peo propose 15 Flinn Drive 8 |Ton| $100.00 $800.00 $300.00 $2,400.00 NO BID NO BID
18 Traffic Control 15 Flinn Drive 1 LS $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Total of all extended prices for unit price work TOTAL $172,076.00 $189,367.00 Non-Responsive
(subject to final adjustment based on actual quantities) *MBE
**WBE

NOTE: This will be a unit price contract. Quantities are approximate and
payment shall be for actual in-place work measurements.



