BID 25-0038-3
Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Chemicals
Bid Due: April 29, 2025

ES OPCO USA, LLC DBA Veseris
Orlando, FL

Rentokil North America, Inc. DBA Target Specialty Products
Baton Rouge, LA

ADAPCO, LLC
Lake Mary, FL

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
st. Charles, IL

W Items a|  Copaner vom Menufacturer /Trade Formulation price vear 1 | price ear2 | Toalcost | MenUfacturer/Trade Formulation Pricevear1 | priceYear2 | Totlcost | Momufacturer/Trade Formulation Prce Year 1 | Price Year2 | TotalCost | Menufacturer/Trade Formulation Price Year 1 | PriceYear2 | Total Cost
Adulticides: Adulticides: (Please indicate "Trade Names" of product and Al%) Adulticides: (Please indicate "Trade Names" of product and Al%) Adulticides: (Please indicate "Trade Names" of product and Al%) Adulticides: (Please indicate "Trade Names" of product and Al%)
1 Sumethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per's Gal Case No bid No Bid No bid Clarke, Anvil 10+10 | 10% Sumithrin, 10%PBO [ § 162784 | 1627.8] $ 325568
"2 Sumett 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum No bid No Bid No bid Clarke, Anvil 10+10 | 10% Sumithrin, 10%PBO [ §  9535.86( § 953586 § 1907172
ke, Anvil 10+
3 Sumethrin 1| Tote (specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid No Bid Cla ke':";n;i 10,275 | 1034 sumithrin, 10% PBO | § 85,909.70| § 85909.70 $  171,819.40)
41| Sumethrin(dual- )y 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Duet Pralethrin SUSumithrin| ¢ 1287.00( s 128700 s 257400
action) 5B
#rs | Sumethrin (dual- |y 30GalDrum | Per30GalCase No bid No Bid No bid Clarke, Duet prallethrin Ssumithrin,| ¢ 7 47a50( s 747450( s 14949.00
action) 5B
e 5“"“::“":;‘]““‘ 1| Tote (specity size) Per Tote No Bid NoBid No Bid Clarke, Duet, 275 gl tote %P'a”e'h”s";:;s“'“"h”"' $ 6527070| § 6527070| §  130,541.40)
g1y | Sumethrin(dual- )y 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Dueetip | ¥Fralethrinstsumitrin| ¢y pc e | s 16| s 251362
action) 5B
#rg | Sumethrin(dual- |y 30GalDrum | Per30GalCase Noid No Bid No bid Clarke, Dueetip | ¥PralethrinsSumithrin | ¢ 7 o667| s 06887| s 1413774
action) 5B
methrin (dual- Tarke, ) ralethrin, .
#rg | Sumethrn (dual |y | rore (specifySize) Per Tote No Bid No Bid No Bid Clrke, Duet HD, 275 gal. | Prallethrin SSumithrin,| ¢ ¢4303.00( s 64,303.00( $  128,606.00,
action) tote 5B
Fermethrin 4.6%
*Piperonyt CS1- Permsease 3-15 | 3% Permethrin 15% PBO
#110|  permethrin 1 5 GalCase PersGalCase | Masterline/kontrol | Butoddeas%Other |$ 15212|$  1s2:2|s 30424 Envu Permanone30-30 | §  soass|s  s3as 1o3s0a| O Jeoeese e |5 27as0[s 290955 sesas| Clarke,miomist3e1s | 3w permethin 1% pe0 | s 3w7so| s msoofs  7m2se
Permlentghrreindide.n6t 258 priced by 225l
s4c Qv pinttoramt
Butoxide 4.6% Other
#1111 Permethrin 1 30Gal Drum Per30GalCase | Masterline/Kontrol | Permientghrreindide.nst [ §  865.00( $  865.00( $  1,730.00 Envu Permanone30-30 | §  225000( $  2,368.42 61802 & P“;'I'ii::jz'ls s W;fz:‘i‘:‘;g‘;jfﬁo $ 301950| $ 320085 S 6219.95| Clarke, Biomist3+15 | 3% Permethrin, 15% P8O | $  1,95000| § 2025.00[ $ 397500
545 9*0Pintkeromt i
Butoxide 4.6% Other
#12 permethrin 1| Tote (specify Size) perTote | Masterline/Kontrol 275 |, L ighreridniean0w| § 7,815.00 $ 7,815.00| §  15,630.00 Envu Permanone 30-30 (2756) | $  23,000.00| $ 2421052 47,210,57 | C51 - PermSease 3-15 (275 | 3% Permethrin 1% PBO | ¢ ¢ o5, 50| ¢ 1600325 | 5 31,100.75 | COKe BIOMISL3NIS 275 | 5o o iin, 15%pBO | § 1705000 §  146250| 5 1851250
Gal Tote engerdniesn dltote) priced by 275 gltote galtote
Butoride 30% Other o permserse 44 (2| (SR PeTmE I A5
#113|  permethrin 1 5 GalCase Per5GalCase |  Masterline/Kontrol | Ingredients Permethrin | $  55000[ $  550.00[ §  1,200.00| cCentraLie Sciences Permx4-4 s me|s s 436.43 e (@2 veoprcedbyzasgl [ wrn0|s  wasos 2130 No 8id
0054% *Pineranyl cace
Butoride 30% Other
#1114 Permethrin 1 30Gal Drum Per30GalCase |  Masterline/Kontrol | Ingredients Permethrin | $ 2,850.00| $ 2,85000| $  5700.00 No Bid CSl-PermSease 4-4 (sSgl| 46% Permethrind.6% | ¢ 4 1o500| ¢ 15505| s 3,005 No Bid
edlents permethr drum) PRO priced by 55 gl drum
Butoride 30% Other
15 permethrin 1| Tote (specify Size) PerTote | Masterline/Kontrol 275 |\ ients Permethrin | § 24,897.00| § 24,897.00| § 49,794.00| Central Life Sciences Permx 4-4 s 887906|5 934638 18,225 44 | CSI-PermSease 44275 | 4% Permethrin 4% | ¢ o7y 00| ¢ 63000[ s 1245750 No 8id
Gal Tote e et eltote) PBO priced by 275 gl tote
Butoride 30% Other
#116] permethrin 1 5GalCase Pers Gal Case | Masterine/Aquakontrol | o ot permethrin | $ 70000 $ 70000 § 140000 NoBid CSI- PermSease 30-30 | 30% Permethrin 30% PBO| ¢ 50 00| 6 39400 5 769.00 No Bid
(2125 gl case) priced by 2x2.5 gl case
4300%5% *pineranyl
#107|  permethrin 1 30GalDrum | Per30 Gal Case | Masterine/AduaKontrol | - Butoxide 30% Other | ¢, o500 ¢ 405000( § 810000 Envu Permanone 31-66disc. | $ 380246 3,802.45 | 5!~ Permsease 30-30 (30| 20% Permethrin 30% PRO| ¢ 5 55500 | ¢ 3 36250( s 461250 No Bid
Ingredients 40% el drum) priced by 30 gl drum
. Permanone 31-66 (2756) CSl- PermSease 30-30 | 30% Permethrin 30% PBO
- rmethri T T y y : i
118|  permethrin 1| Tote (specity Size) per Tote Noid Envu oy $ 3713365 37,132.65 Pl oy st | $ 2076250 $ 280200 5 4256450 No 8id
3L15% permethrin
#1.19 permethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid ot '(:*;':5;1’;:]”7 66.85% PRO priced by | §  72500[§ 76225 s 14875 No 8id
3L15% permethrin
#1-20) Permethrin 1 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid NoBid ol pe";f:fj:‘f 167 (30| 66 g5% a0 priced by 30 | § 4,35000[ § 4s6750( s 891750 No Bid
ol drum
3115% Permethrin
#1121 permethrin 1| Tote (specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid st T;S'“;E::‘j"” 66.87%PBO priced by | $ 39,875.00| $ 41,868.75| § 8174375 No 8id
75 ol tore
0.6% Permethrin 20 6%
122 permethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid CSl-PermSease UC20-20| "oy o iedby 2asgl | $  625.00|§  65625( 6 128125 No 8id
(2x2.5 gl case) e
CS1- Permsease UC 20-20 | 20.6% Permethrin 20.6%
- rmethri 2 !
123)  permethrin 1 30Gal Drum er 30 Gal Case NoBid NoBid P 20 arcaiy Sou | $ 375000 | § 3s330[ 768750 No Bid
G- Permsease UC 2020
20.6% Permethrin 20.6%
24 rmethri T T g : : i
12 permethrin 1| Tote (specity size) per Tote NoBid NoBid a2 ey | $ #37500| $ 3609375 5 7046875 No 8id
1.z Pyrethrins (Organic | -y 4Gal Case Per 4 Gal Case Noid No Bid No bid No Bid
Formulation)
126 PV':':"""::S::?"“ 1 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Merus 5% Pyrethrin s 222210)8 222210[ 8 444420
a1.z7| Prethrins Organic | 5 Gal Pai Per s Gal pail No Bid MoK Evergreen ULV5+25 | 130401 1,304.01 No bid No Bid
Formulation)
.28 PV'::':"""::S’;:?"“ 1 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid MoK Evergreen ULV 5425 | § 771158 771158 No Bid Clarke, Merus 5% Pyrethrin $ 1245120[§ 1245120 $  24,902.40,
#1-29] PV'::':"""::S’;:?"“ 1 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid MoK Evergreen ULV 5425 | § 13,344.40 13344.40 NoBid Clarke, Merus 5% Pyrethrin $ 2259.75|$ 2259675 $ 4519350,
#1.30| Pyrethrins Organic | | o0 (qpeciy size) Per Tote No Bid MGK Evergreen ULVS425 | ¢ o 41850 50,418.50 No Bid Clarke, Merus, 275 gal 5% Pyrethrin $112,006.75 | § 11299675 §  225,903.50
Formulation) (2756) tote
w13 Prethrins Organic | 4Gal Case Per 4 Gal Case NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
y1.32|  Pyrethrins (Organic | -y 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
y1.33| Pyrethrins (Organic | -y 5 Gal Pail Per 5 Gal Pal No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
4134 Pyrethrins (Organic | -, 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
s1.3s| Prethrins Organic | 55 Gal Drum per Drum NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
s3] Prrethiins Organic |y | rore (Specity Size) per Tote NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
#9137  Chorpyfifos 1 30GalDrum | Per30GalCase NoBid NoBid No Bid Clarke, MosquitoMist 15 | 19.36% Chioropyrifos | $  2,627.04| $  2,627.04| S 525008
38| Chlorpyfifos 1 S5GalDrum | PerSS Gal Case Noid No Bid No bid Clarke, MosquitoMist 15 | 19.36% Chloropyrifos | $ 4.729.12| § 472012 s 9458.24
w139 Chlorpyfifos 1| Tote (specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid No bid ke MosuitoMISt LS, | 10 36% Chioropyrifos | § 2398220| § 23.98220( § 47,9440
. Jathion 40:
#1-40) Malathion 1| Tote (Specity Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid ENVU - Fyfanon EW (264 M“':y“’z"s“:f::‘z”‘“ $ 202692 | $ 2128368 | § 4155360 No Bid
. Jathion 40:
a1 Malathion 1| rum(specifySize) | PerDrum No Bid No Bid ENVU - Fyfanon EW (508l M2 a::(“;"o ;:’:’:”‘“ S 383900 403100| 5 787000 No Bid
#1-42| Naled EC Formulation | 1 30 Gal Drum per Drum NoBid NoBid AMGUARD - Trumpet EC Naled 78.0% S 902850| $ 948000 1850850 No Bid
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BID 25-0038-3
Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Chemicals ES OPCO USA, LLC DBA Veseris Rentokil North America, Inc. DBA Target Specialty Products ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
nnual Contract for Mosquito Control Chemicals Orlando, FL Baton Rouge, LA Lake Mary, FL St. Charles, IL
Bid Due: April 29, 2025
W Items a|  Copaner vom Menufacturer /Trade Formulation price vear 1 | price ear2 | Totalcost | Menufacturer/Trade Formulation Pricevear1 | priceYear2 | Tomlcost | Mmufacturer/Trade Formulation Prce Year 1 | Price Year2 |  TotalCost | Menufacturer/Trade Formulation Price Year 1 | PriceYear2 | Total Cost
z Tenpr -
143 Etofenprox 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum entral Life erprox20% Ot |'s 103700 s 1037400 s 2074800 CentralLie sciences Zenivex £20 $ 1037400 s 1037400 No Bid s, zenivex 20%Etofenprox | $ 10,695.00( § 10,695.00( §  21,390.00
#-44|  Dehtamethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per Case No Bid Envu DefaGard UV |5 140000| 5 14s833| 5 g5 O FENSE SCinsecticde s Delomethrinpricedby | gy p5y06| 5 131560( 5 256856 No Bid
45| ettamethrin | 1 30 Gal Drum per Drum NoBid Envu DeltaGard ULV | 'S 816000| S 850000| S 1666000 No gid No Bid
w1as|  Dettamethrin | 1 5 GalCase per Case Noid Envu Imperium s 140000|s 14s833)s 285833 No Bid No Bid
47| ettamethrin | 1 30 Gal Drum per Drum NoBid Envu Imperium s 816000| s 850000( S 1666000 No gid No Bid
Sips speciy AMGUARD - Nuvan | Dichlorvos 18.6% priced
#1-48] Dichlorvos 1 s Bp Per Case No Bid No Bid Prostrips by 618 $ 172584 $ 181224 353808 No Bid
Quantity)
Plus (618 cages per case) | cages per case)
Fenpropathrin/ VBC - Remoa Tri (2x2.5 ! [4.0% Fenpropathrin; 1.5%
#-a9) 1 5 Gal per G
Abamectin/C.8910 al Case er Case No bid No Bid ) e oy | § 157500 § 165375| s 32875 No Bid
Fenpropathrin/ VBC - Remoa Tri (301 |4.0% Fenpropathrin; 1.5%|
#1-50) 1 30Gal O Per D
Abamectin/C.8910 2l Drum, er Drum No bid No Bid pi e sy | § 900000| § 945000| $ 18,4500 No Bid
Fenpropathrin/ VBC- Remoa Tri(264 g1 [4.0% Fenpropathrin; 1.5%
w51 1| Tote (specitysi Per Tot
Abamectin/C-8910 ote (Specify Size) er Tote No Bid No Bid tote) ‘Abamectin: 1.0% C.go10 | 5 7920000 | $ 83,160.00| $  162,360.00) NoBid
prSS—— AMGUARD - Avesta (8<1 | Lambda Cyhalothrin 8.7%
152 BarrierProduct | 1 per Case NoBid No Bid at priced s srsoals eossals  117mss No Bid
D5D/Label) cacel b Rt ot s
> T i
53| BarrierProduct | 1 5 Gal Case Per Case No Bid Env suspendBOVIone s | oa3076| s gm17| s asrees|"MOUARD Wisdomibdl Sk ienthin pricedby | g ygr8) s a0780|s  aoses No Bid
#4158  Bamerproduct | 1|  55GalDrum per Drum NoBid Envu suspendPolyeone B0 1 1 6057[ s 1320512 s 21,800.00] BVABAMBXFLhON [ Refined MineralOIW/ | sy 16575 s 120705]'s 2050 Nosid
#1:55|  BarrierProduct | 1| 1280z Bottes Per Case No gid Central Life Sciences Mavrik s aes00|s  asoa7|s  osaa7 MGK'c"::X“:)’d rat mz'“""”;:’;:["‘m &5 100530 s vomss|s 204988 No Bid
Larvicides: (33) Larvicides: (33) Larvicides: (33) Larvicides: (33) Larviides: (33)
4.25% Methroprene,
#21 | Methoprene Products | 1 Specify Size Per Case No Bid No Bid VBC-Metalary )x»w (800 priced by $ 196000| $ 2,06000| 5 402400 No 8id
percs 800 Wplcase
] 7 ]
#2-2 | Altosid® XR Briquets | 1 Case (220) Per Case CentralLife Methoprene 7.9% | s ge6.80{s 86680 S 1733.60| CentralLife Sciences Altosid XR $ 86680 $ 866.80 No Bid CentralLife Scences, 21%Methoprene | 86680( $  86680( S 173360
OTHER INGR Altosid XK
N Central Life Methoprene 87.9% ;
w23|  Aosid®XRingots | 1 Case (220) Per Case ) S 86680[$ 86680[ S 173360| Centrallife Sciences AtosidXp/sim | $ 86680 s 6680 No bid CLS,Atosid XRIngot |  21%Methoprene | $ 86680 S se6s0[S 173360
Sciences/Altosid OTHER INGR
] - T
#24|  Aosid® sR-20 1 5 Gal Case. Per Case Central Life "‘“"If‘";émz MR 1S 537200( s 5372.00( S 1078.00]  CentralLife Sciences Altosid SR-20 s 537200 s 537200 No Bid LS, Altosid SR-20 20%Methoprene | $ 537200| $  537200| $  10,744.00
] rene .
w2s | Aoside pellets | 1 a4 Case Per Case Central Life prene IR R |'s 1am700( s 128700[ 5 25700[ centraltte sciences Altosid Pellets s 128700 s 128700 No Bid LS, Attosid Pellets 425%Methoprene | $ 1287.00( § 1,28700[ $  2,574.00
6| Atosd® pellets | 1 WORbar Per Bor No 6id No 6id No Bid
] 5% ot
W27 Altosid® XRG 1 40 Bag Per 401 Bag CentralLife rrene O s anoo|s a2e0|s  s200| centalliesciences Altosid XR-G s 41200 $ 41200 NoBid CLs, Attosid XR-G 4.25%Methoprene | $ 41200 $ 41200 § 820.00
] 5% 0
ws|  Aoside XrG 1| 10008 Supersack | per 1 Bag Central Life oorene L0V | 5 1020000 5 10.20000( 5 20400.00] centra e sciences Altosid XR-G $ 1020000 s 1020000 No Bid €L, Altosid XR-G 425%Methoprene | $ 10,20000( $ 10,2000 §  20,400.00
] 3% O
W29 | Altosid® SBG 1 40 Bag Per 401 Bag CentralLfe ovrene 0o ™ s 1s000|s 1s000[ s 30000| centrallie sciences Alosid $8G $ 15000 $ 150,00 NoBid s, Attosid SBG 03%Methoprene | $ 15000( $  15000| $ 30000
] 3% O
w10 Atosid® s8G 1| 10008 Supersack | per i Bag Central Life ovrene 0o ™ s 37000| s 375000[ 5 7.50000| centralLie siences Altosid $BG s 375000 s 375000 No Bid CLs, Altosid SBG 0.3% Methoprene
] rene .
W[ Altosid® P35 1 40 Bag Per 401 Bag Central e prened RN s s000|s sw000] s 162000f contralte sciences Altosid P-35. s 81000 $ 81000 NoBid L, Altosid P35 4.25%Methoprene | $ 81000| $ 81000 $ 162000
] rene .
2| Altoside P35 1| 10008 Supersack | per i Bag Central Life prene 2% R | s 2020000( 5 2020000 5 a0,40000f  central e sciences Altosid p-35 $ 2020000 s 2020000 No Bid No Bid
] rene .
13| Alosid® 35 1| 20008 Supersack |  Per2kBag CentralLife prene 2% R | s 4040000| 5 0,000 5 8080000  centralufe sciences Altosid P-35 $ 4040000 S 40,400.00 No bid s, Attosid P35 425%Methoprene | $ 40,40000| $ 40,40000( §  80,800.00
] rene .
w1 Alosid® wsp 1 Case (800) Per Case CentralLife prened TR R s so000|s  so00o| s 160000f centraltte sciences Altosid WsP $ 80000 $ 80000 NoBid LS, Altosid WsP 4.25%Methoprene | $ 80000| $  800.00( $ 160000
] 5%
15|  Atosid*Pro-G | 1|  24xi0ozcase Per Case CentralLife rrene O s 2e3e0|s 2e0s0[s  soar0 No bid No bid LS, Altosid Pro-G 1.5% Methoprene
] 5% 0
w216 Atosid®ProG | 1| 25kbsackCase per Case CentralLife orrene O s sasao|s ssooo|s 108940 contrallie sciences Altosid Pro-G s 46500 $ 46500 NoBid L, Altosid Pro-G 1.5% Methoprene
W217]  Atosid*ProG | 1|  100zShaker Per Case No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid
] Tess:
#2-18|  Altosid® Duplex-G | 1 408 Bag Per 401 Bag  CentrallLife 59355 6) e S 65600[$  65600[ S 131200| Centrallife Sciences Altosid Duplex-G | §  656.00 s 65600 Noid cLs, Duplex-G s 6s600|S  es600[S 131200
] e 535% () . DuplexcG,
#2-19|  Altosid® Duplex-G | 1 | 1,008 Supersack | per 1k Bag  CentralLife e5535% () Methoprene | ¢ 3360000 5 32.600.00| 5 65,20000]  centralute sciences Atosid Duplex-G | § 32,600.00 s 3260000 No bid €L Duplex 6, 20008 e $ 32,60000($ 3260000($ 6520000
#a-z0|  Monomolecular -y 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid
Lanviciding Fiim
Non- 97% Mineral Oilpriced b
#2:21|  separating/settiing | 1 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid BVAOils BVA2LarvicideOll | $  75000| $  789.47|$ 153947 BvABVA2Lanvicide oI gl o AWl 115500 s 121275| s 236775 No 8id
L anviciting 01l
2| BTVMethoprene 307 Bag (include VEC - Metalary ST (4016 | 4.25% Methroprene,
12| ETVMethoprene | foag e per Bag No Bid No Bid o S eroree |5 100240] s 1306005 250840 No Bid
Bacilus thuringiens’s
23| BT AllAvailable |, 5 Gal Case/ Per Case Becker Microbial | ecies8.00%Other | $  18550[§ 18705 $  37275|  summit Chemicals Fallout LQ s a0000($ 22200(s apop| VBC:Vectobacl2As | LekBipricedby | 5503|4075 s 47005 No 8id
Formulations) formulation Products/aquaoc xT | SUpsPecies 800 O (2125 gl case) 2@.5glcase
Bacillus thuringiensis
871 (A1l Available Becker Microblal | pspecies 43.00% Other VBC- Vectobac 124 (30 | 11.61% Btipriced by 30 g1
24 1 30 Gal Drum perDrum | products/AquaBac WDG ” $ 203500( $ 207500| $ 4211000  Summit chemicals Fallout LQ S 116250[S 126358 S 242608 : priced Y308\ 136920( $ 143760 5 280680 No 8id
Formulations) o Ingredients &l drum) drum
5700
AV - me 76 (@0 |11 i
w2as| BT (AllAvailable |, 3548ag Per Bag No Bid NoBid vec v‘::’;;g’r‘ FG (40 | 11.61% i :::“ by40lol e 17600| s 1sasols 360.80|  CLS, Fourstar BTI CRG 10% Bt s ss230|s  s5230(s 1,040
Bacilus thuringiensis SummitBT1 Granules 5/8
226 BT (AllAvailable |, 404 Bag Per Bag Becker Microbial | o ecies286% Other | § 7200 7600[$  148.00|  summit Chemicals or s 7rso|s  sean|s 163,61 VBC-VectobacGorCG | 11.61% Buipricedbyor | ¢ og 40l ¢ gop| g 160.40 No 8id
Formulations) Products/Aquaac 200G | “oePeces 289% O - (4010 bag)
AV it BT1 Granul - 7.5 8% pri
wz7| BT AIAvaiable 10004 Bag per Bag No Bid summitchemicals | "M T SUSE gy grso0] s ggaian| s ssspan| VOO veaoacWoG | STakmtpricedbyash [ gy 550! 5 proaso| s 233600] cis,Fourstar s ch 10% Bti $ 1577000| 5 1577000[ § 31,5400
. 75% 85 pr
i-a| Bacilus sphaericus |y Case (800) Per Case No Bid Becker Microbials spheramxsogwse | 5 e2500[ 5 mesaa| s weonay| VOO VectoleWst Sbpreed 80 | esoo|s s0600|s 15700 No Bid
#2.29| Bacillus sphaericus (Al | - 404 Bag Per 40# Bag No Bid Becker Microbials Spheratax 506 s aa3s|s  2me7|s aga0p | VBC-VectolexFG (401 | 7.5% Bspriced by 401b | ¢ yec 6| 6 30000 5 585.60 No 8id
Available Partcle Sizes) bag) bag
VBC- VECTONAX FG (40
Bacillus sphaericus & 1b bag) 79 Bs; 4.5% Bt piced by .
#2-30) 1 400 per C i
BTIWSP /case Yer Case No Bid No Bid VBC - Vectomax WSP W0lbb $  40840|S 43000 % 838.40 No Bid
500/
VBC-VECTOMAX FG (40
Bacillus sphaericus & 1b bag) 2.7%Bs; 4.5% Btipriced
w31 1 800/ per C 768, y
BTIWSP /Case ercase No bid No bid VBC - Vectomax WSP by8OOWsP/case | ° LOS000| S 1768001 S 344800 No Bid
TAvatab T i
e R I case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Netular XK, 625%spinosad | $ 114410 $  114420|$ 228820
33| SPos2d (NTAVaTable [ oy gag (speciy Quantin| — per 40t Bag No Bid No gid No Bid Clrke, Natular 630, 408 2.5% Spinosad s 7sesa|s 75840 s 151694
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BID 25-0038-3
Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Chemicals ES OPCO USA, LLC DBA Veseris Rentokil North America, Inc. DBA Target Specialty Products ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
nnual Contract for Mosquito Control Chemicals Orlando, FL Baton Rouge, LA Lake Mary, FL st. Charles, IL
Bid Due: April 29, 2025

W tems a|  Copaner uom Menufacturer /Trade Formulation price vear 1 | price ear2 | Totalcost | Menufacturer/Trade Formulation Pricevear1 | priceYear2 | Tomlcost | Mmufacturer/Trade Formulation Prce Year 1 | Price Year2 |  TotalCost | Menufacturer/Trade Formulation Price Year 1 | PriceYear2 | Total Cost
34| SPosed (A Avalable [y No Bid No gid No Bid Clarke, Natular G20.10001 5 5 pinosad $ 1863200( 5 1863200 37,264.00
35| SPnosed (W Avallable [ No gid No gid No Bid Clrke, Natular 6, 301> 0.5% Spinosad s a0s0|s  0s0|s 74160
236 Sonossd W valble [y Noid NoBid Noid Clorke, Nawlar 6, 10000 | 5 pinosad |5 se9200| s sa200|s 1778400

| Spnosad (Al Available Clarke, Natular G3OWS?,
237 4 M 1 No 8id NoBid No Bid L o 25%spinosad | S e2570| s e2570[s 125140
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Diluent Oils: (1) Diluent Oils: (1) Diluent Oils: (1) Diluent Oils: (1) Diluent Oils: (1)

BVA 13 OlL price by 55 g1
drum

$ 100120($ 120010 220130 No Bid

3.1 | Diluent Oils (BVA Grade
13)

1 55 Gal Drum Per Drum $ 70000 $  70000|$ 140000 BVA Oils BVAULV 13 $  75000($ 81200 $ 156200 BVABVA13

Total Bid s 348,871.69 $ 392,676.70 $ 561,080.43 $ 1,186,762.90
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