
BID 24-0089-4 ANNUAL CONTRACT TO PROVIDE VARIOUS AMMUNITION PRODUCTS AND 

SUPPLIES (REBID)                                                                                                                                                                      

BID DUE: JULY 1, 2024 @ 2PM
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#0-1 Hornady Training Handgun (90238) 9mm 135gr FMJ Training Brass. Case of 500. 1190 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $210 $249,900.00 500 $419.50 $499,205.00

#0-2 Hornady Critical Duty (90225) 9mm 135gr +P Flex-Lock. Case of 500. 76 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $282 $21,432.00 500 $405.76 $30,837.76

#0-3 Simunition FX (5330003) 9mm FX Orange GEN2 Marking Round. Case of 500. 9 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $340 $3,060.00 500 $339 $3,051.00

#0-4 Simunition FX (5330005) 9mm FX Green GEN2 Marking Round. Case of 500. 9 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $340 $3,060.00 500 $339 $3,051.00

#0-5 Hornady Training Rifle (80271) .223REM 55gr FMJ Training. Case of 500. 160 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $239.40 $38,304.00 500 $336.94 $53,910.40

#0-6 Hornady TAP (83286) .223REM 60gr TAP Urban. Case of 200. 54 CS NO BID $0 $0 200 $169.92 $9,175.68 200 $389.50 $21,033.00

#0-7 Simunition FX (5359101) 5.56mm FX Red Marking Round M4/M16. Case of 200. 6 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $425 $2,550.00 500 $420 $2,520.00

#0-8 Federal Cartridge Top Gun (TGL12-7.5) 12 GA 2 3/4” 1 1/8oz #7.5. Case of 250. 108 CS NO BID $0 $0 250 $99 $10,692.00 250 $129.90 $14,029.20

#0-9 Federal Cartridge Tactical (LE132-00) 12 GA 9-pellet 00Buck LR. Case of 250. 33 CS NO BID $0 $0 250 $199 $6,567.00 250 $294.12 $9,705.96

#0-10 Federal Cartridge Tactical (LE127-RS) 12 GA 1oz Rifled Slug LR.  Case of 250. 33 CS NO BID $0 $0 250 $199 $6,567.00 250 $234.71 $7,745.43

#0-11 CCI (30) .22LR MiniMag 40gr CPRN. Case of 200. 30 CS NO BID $0 $0 5000 $359 $10,770.00 200 $12.95 $388.50

#0-12 PepperBall Inert. Count of 375 per jar/container. 5 JAR/CONTAINER 375 $284.71 $1,423.55 No Bid $0 $0 375 $289 $1,445.00

#0-13 PepperBall Live-X. Count of 375 per jar/container. 3 JAR/CONTAINER 375 $1,095.30 $3,285.90 No Bid $0 $0 375.00 $1,084.00 $3,252.00

#0-14 Hornady (HOR90080) .380Auto 90gr Critical Defense. Case of 250. 8 CS NO BID $0 $0 250 $203.52 $1,628.16 250 $369.50 $2,956.00

#0-15 Hornady (HOR83285) .223 62gr Barrier TAP. Case of 200. 50 CS NO BID $0 $0 200 $169.92 $8,496.00 200 $244.82 $12,241.00

#0-16 Hornady (HOR86265) 12ga TAP Reduced Recoil 8 Pellet 00B. Case of 100. 20 CS NO BID $0 $0 100 $95 $1,900.00 100 $146.35 $2,927.00

#0-17 Hornady (HOR86235) 12ga Light Magnum 1oz Foster Slug. Case of 100. 20 CS NO BID $0 $0 100 $154.80 $3,096.00 100 $234.12 $4,682.40

#0-18 Hornady 300 Black Out 111gr Monoflex TAP (80865). Case of 200. 250 CS NO BID $0 $0 200 $260.64 $65,160.00 200 $375.41 $93,852.50

#0-19 Hornady 300 Black Out 110gr Frangible (80870). Case of 500. 100 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $448.68 $44,868.00 500 $666.82 $66,682.00

#0-20 Hornady 6.5 Creedmoor 147gr ELD Match (81505). Case of  200. 250 CS NO BID $0 $0 200 $292.32 $73,080.00 200 $421.17 $105,292.50

#0-21 Hornady Training Handgun (90924) .45ACP 220gr FMJ Training Brass. Case of 500. 50 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $282.60 $14,130.00 500 $407.06 $20,353.00

#0-22 Hornady Critical Duty (90925) .45ACP 220gr Flex-Lock. Case of 500. 6 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $346.20 $2,077.20 500 $499.88 $2,999.28

#0-23 Hornady Training Rifle (81292) 5.56mm 75gr SBR TRN.  Case of 500. 40 CS NO BID $0 $0 500 $306 $12,240.00 500 $440.82 $17,632.80

#0-24 Hornady TAP (81295) 5.56mm 75gr SBR. Case of 200. 15 CS NO BID $0 $0 200 $182.76 $2,741.40 200 $263.53 $3,952.95

#0-25 Sabre Inert Training Projectile .68 Caliber Projectile. Case of 500. 5 CS NO BID $0 $0 No Bid $0 $0 500 $270 $1,350.00

#0-26 Sabre 1.0% MC + 4.0% PAVA .68 Caliber Projectile. Case of 500. 2 CS NO BID $0 $0 No Bid $0 $0 500 $840 $1,680.00

#0-27 Combined Tactical Systems (2581) 12 GA Super-Sock Bean Bag 275 ROUNDS NO BID $0 $0 5 $31.50 $8,662.50 1 $6.96 $1,914.00

#0-28 Hornady (HOR90311) .38 110gr+P Critical Defense. Case of 250. 8 CS NO BID $0 $0 250 $230.64 $1,845.12 250 $306 $2,448.00

ACK. of Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes

Total Cost

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.                                      

Sugar Hill, GA

G T Distributors, Inc.                                    

Pflugerville, TX

Gulf States Distributors, Inc.                            

Montgomery, AL

$991,137.68$4,709.45 $602,002.06


