
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY (EA)
DELIVERY 

TIMEFRAME 
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DELIVERY 

TIMEFRAME 
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DELIVERY 

TIMEFRAME 
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1
2026 FORD EXPLORER ACTIVE 4WD

(As specified in Section II -A)
2 No Bid -$                     90 Days 36,320.00$     72,640.00$         120 Days 39,035.00$     78,070.00$         

2
2026 FORD EXPLORER ACTIVE RWD

(As specified in Section II -B)
5 No Bid -$                     90 Days 38,315.00$     191,575.00$       120 Days 37,114.00$     185,570.00$       

3
FORD RANGER XL

(As specified in Section II -C)
2 No Bid -$                     90 Days 33,100.00$     66,200.00$         120 Days 35,306.00$     70,612.00$         

4
FORD RANGER XL 4X4

(As specified in Section II -D)
7 No Bid -$                     100 Days 36,725.00$     257,075.00$       120 Days 39,829.00$     278,803.00$       

5
FORD F-150® XL SUPER CAB  4X4

(As specified in Section II -E)
3 No Bid -$                     85 Days 46,400.00$     139,200.00$       120 Days 47,621.00$     142,863.00$       

6
FORD ESCAPE ACTIVE

(As specified in Section II -F)
2 No Bid -$                     No Bid -$                 -$                     No Bid -$                     

7
FORD F350 XL SUPER DUTY CREW CAB DRW 

W/ 8’ BOX (As specified in Section II -G)
3 90-120 Days 69,000.00$     207,000.00$       140 Days 62,160.00$     186,480.00$       120 Days 64,168.00$     192,504.00$       

8
FORD F150 XL SUPER CREW

(As specified in Section II -H)
1 No Bid -$                     95 Days 44,555.00$     44,555.00$         120 Days 45,586.00$     45,586.00$         

9
FORD TRANSIT CARGO VAN

(As specified in Section II -I)
1 No Bid -$                     100 Days 49,095.00$     49,095.00$         120 Days 49,748.00$     49,748.00$         

207,000.00$       1,006,820.00$   1,043,756.00$   

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY (EA)
DELIVERY 

TIMEFRAME 
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DELIVERY 

TIMEFRAME 
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1
2026 FORD EXPLORER ACTIVE 4WD

(As specified in Section II -A)
2 120 Days 40,288.00$     80,576.00$         48,989.00$     97,978.00$         

2
2026 FORD EXPLORER ACTIVE RWD

(As specified in Section II -B)
5 120 Days 38,388.00$     191,940.00$       47,989.00$     239,945.00$       

3
FORD RANGER XL

(As specified in Section II -C)
2 120 Days 36,788.00$     73,576.00$         42,989.00$     85,978.00$         

4
FORD RANGER XL 4X4

(As specified in Section II -D)
7 120 Days 40,388.00$     282,716.00$       46,989.00$     328,923.00$       

5
FORD F-150® XL SUPER CAB  4X4

(As specified in Section II -E)
3 120 Days 48,588.00$     145,764.00$       57,989.00$     173,967.00$       

6
FORD ESCAPE ACTIVE

(As specified in Section II -F)
2 No Bid -$                     35,989.00$     71,978.00$         

7
FORD F350 XL SUPER DUTY CREW CAB DRW 

W/ 8’ BOX (As specified in Section II -G)
3 120 Days 68,388.00$     205,164.00$       78,989.00$     236,967.00$       

8
FORD F150 XL SUPER CREW

(As specified in Section II -H)
1 120 Days 49,588.00$     49,588.00$         54,989.00$     54,989.00$         

9
FORD TRANSIT CARGO VAN

(As specified in Section II -I)
1 120 Days 49,288.00$     49,288.00$         55,989.00$     55,989.00$         

1,078,612.00$   1,346,714.00$   

TIME REQUIRED FOR DELIVERY IS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER. 

AWARD MAY BE CONTINGENT ON DELIVERY TIMEFRAME.

Ack. Of Addendum No. 1

BID 25-0139-3

PURCHASE OF VARIOUS FORD VEHICLES FOR VARIOUS CHATHAM COUNTY 

DEPARTMENTS

Bid Due 11/6/2025 @2:00 PM

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

One Nation Distribution, LLC.

New Wilmington, PA

Roberts International

Savannah, GA

J.C. Lewis Ford

Savannah, GA

O.C. Welch Ford Lincoln

Hardeeville, SC

Total Cost

BID 25-0139-3

PURCHASE OF VARIOUS FORD VEHICLES FOR VARIOUS CHATHAM COUNTY 

DEPARTMENTS

Bid Due 11/6/2025 @2:00 PM

Beck Auto Sales, Inc.

Palatka FL

Ack. Of Addendum No. 1 Yes

Total Cost


