RFQ 22-0044-3 Annual Pricing for Mosquito Control Chemicals
RFQ DUE: June 8, 2022 @ 5pm

Adapco, LLC
Lake Mary, FL

Target Specialty Products

Norcross, GA

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
St. Charles, IL

# Items Qry Con'Famer uom Manufacturer th eEl Manufacturer Urnt Tz Manufacturer Urut VeiEl
Size Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
Adulticides: (Please indicate "Trade Names" of product and Al%) (27)
#1-1 | Sumethrin10+10 | 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Anvil 10+10, $8,334.90 $8,334.90
Sumithirn 10%
Clarke, Duet, Sumethri
#1-2 | Sumethrin (dual-action)| 1 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, DUet, Sumethrin | «) 180,96 $1,180.96
10% + Prallethrin 1%
Clarke, Duet, Sumethri
#1-3 | Sumethrin (dual-action)| 1 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, DUet, Sumethrin | «¢ 991 80 $6,991.80
10% + Prallethrin 1%
Clarke, 275 gal tote,
#1-4 |Sumethrin (dual-action)| 1 Tote (Specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Duet, Sumethrin 10% + | $59,208.85 $59,208.85
Prallethrin 1%
#1-5 Permethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case | 5! -Permasease 3-15 | o0 g $275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Biomist 30+30, $467.50 $467.50
(2x2.5 gl case) Permethrin 30%
€SI - PermaSease 3-15 Clarke, Biomist 30+30
#1-6 Permethrin 1 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case ermasease $1,650.00 | $1,650.00 Bayer $4,200.00 | $4,200.00 arke, Blomis | $2,685.00 $2,685.00
(55 gl drum) Permethrin 30%
€SI - PermaSease 3-15 Clarke, Biomist 30430
#17 Permethrin 1| Tote (Specify Size) Per Tote ermasease $15,125.00 | $15,125.00 Bayer $35,750.00 | $35,750.00 arke, Blomis | $23306.25 | $23306.25
(275 gl drum) Permethrin 30%
y1g | Pyrethrins (Organic |, 4 Gal Case Per 4 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
Pyrethri i larke, Merus, Pyrethri
#1-9 | Pyrethrins (Organic |, 5 Gal Case Per 5 Gal Case No Bid No Bid Nogid | Central Life Sciences | $1,069.34 | s$1,06034 |Clarke, Merus, Pyrethrin | o) 0659 $1,660.20
Formulation) 5%
g1-10| Pyrethrins (Organic | 5 Gal Pail Per 5 Gal Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Formulation)
#r-11| Pyrethrins (Organic | 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nogid | Clarkes Merus, Pyrethrin | oq (1o g0 | $9,649.80
Formulation) 5%
g1-1p| Pyrethrins (Organic | 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid NoBid | Central Life Sciences | $11,682.00 | $11,684.00 |C1rke: Merus Pyrethrin| 10 10650 | $17,470.20
Formulation) 5%
Pyrethri i larke, 275 gal
#1-13| Pyrethrins (Organic || ro (specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid NoBid | Central Life Sciences | $58,420.00 | $58,420.00 Clarke, 275 gal tote, | 71 »5500 | $71,225.00
Formulation) Merus, Pyrethrin 5%
Clarke, MosquitoMist 1.5
#1-14 Chlorpyfifos 1 30 Gal Drum Per 30 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, Mosquitoiviis $1,967.28 $1,967.28
Chlorpyrifos 19.36%
Clarke, MosquitoMist 1.5
#1-15 Chlorpyfifos 1 55 Gal Drum Per 55 Gal Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, Mosquitoiviis $3,582.48 $3,582.48
Chlorpyrifos 19.36%
Clarke, MosquitoMist 1.5
#1-16 Chlorpyfifos 1| Tote (Specify Size) Per Tote No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, Mosquitoviis $17,902.50 | $17,902.50
Chlorpyrifos 19.36%
#1-17 Malathion 1 | Tote (Specify Size) Per Tote FMC Fyfalnt“: L;LV (260 | 419 674.20 | $19,674.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
gl tote
L
#1-18 Malathion 1 | orum(specifysize) |  Perprum  |™C Fyfa;“’” L)J V58! ¢4 50405 | 8429495 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
rum
#1-19 | Naled EC Formulation | 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum Amgu(zrod 'Izrum‘;a EC| ¢7,79520 | $7,795.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
glarum
i 0,
#1-20 Etofenprox 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $9,780.00 $9,780.00 aLs, Ze”'YeX E20%, $9,780.00 $9,780.00
AquaZenivex E20%
#1-21 Deltamethrin 1 5 Gal Case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Bayer $1,125.00 $1,125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-22 Deltamethrin 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid Bayer $6,540.00 $6,540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#1-23 Dichlorvos 1 Strips (Specify Per Case Amguard - Nuvan $288.75 $288.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Quantity) Prostrips (72 cages)
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RFQ 22-0044-3 Annual Pricing for Mosquito Control Chemicals Adapco, LLC Target Specialty Products Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
RFQ DUE: June 8, 2022 @ 5pm Lake Mary, FL Norcross, GA St. Charles, IL
# Items Qry Con'Famer uom Manufacturer Urut el Manufacturer Urnt UetEl Manufacturer Urnt el
Size Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
#1-24|  Barrier Product 1 | 4GalCase (include Per Case CSI-Bifen IT(4x1gl | o553 g9 $223.89 Bayer $1,612.00 $1,612.00 Clarke, Flit 10EC, $584.00 $584.00
DSD/Label) case) Permethrin 10%
. . . . . . . Clarke, Flit 10EC,
#1-25 Barrier Product 1 5 Gal Case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ) $670.16 $670.16
Permethrin 10%
#1-26|  Barrier Product 1 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Flit 10EC, $6,736.84 $6,736.84
Permethrin 10%
Central Life Sciences,
#1-27 Barrier Product 1 12 8oz Bottles Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $426.72 $426.72 Mavrick, Tau-fluvalinate $507.36 $507.36
22.3%
2 Larvicides: (33)
#2-1 | Methoprene Products | 1 Specify Size Per Case Valent BioSciences - ;06 00 | $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Metalarv XRP (400/cs)
#2-2 Altosid® XR Briquets 1 Case (220) Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $787.60 $787.60 Central Life Sciences $787.60 $787.60
#2-3 Altosid® XR Ingots 1 Case (220) Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $787.60 $787.60 Central Life Sciences $787.60 $787.60
#2-4 Altosid® SR-20 1 5 Gal Case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $4,893.00 $4,893.00 Central Life Sciences $4,893.00 $4,893.00
#2-5 Altosid® Pellets 1 444 Case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $1,169.08 $1,169.08 Central Life Sciences $1,169.08 $1,169.08
#2-6 Altosid® Pellets 1 40# Bag Per Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-7 Altosid® XR-G 1 40# Bag Per 40# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $376.00 $376.00 Central Life Sciences $376.00 $376.00
#2-8 Altosid® XR-G 1 1,000# Supersack Per 1k# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $9,300.00 $9,300.00 Central Life Sciences $9,300.00 $9,300.00
#2-9 Altosid® SBG 1 40# Bag Per 40# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $135.20 $135.20 Central Life Sciences $132.20 $132.20
#2-10 Altosid® SBG 1 1,000# Supersack Per 1k# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $3,380.00 $3,380.00 Central Life Sciences $3,380.00 $3,380.00
#2-11 Altosid® P-35 1 40# Bag Per 40# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $748.80 $748.80 Central Life Sciences $748.80 $748.80
#2-12 Altosid® P-35 1 1,000# Supersack Per 1k# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-13 Altosid® P-35 1 2,000# Supersack Per 2k Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $36,300.00 $36,300.00 Central Life Sciences $36,300.00 $36,300.00
#2-14 Altosid® WSP 1 Case (800) Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $736.00 $736.00 Central Life Sciences $736.00 $736.00
#2-15 Altosid® Pro-G 1 24x10 oz case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $186.00 $186.00 Central Life Sciences $182.50 $182.50
#216|  Altosid® Pro-G 1| 25Ibsackcase Per Case No Bid No Bid NoBid | Central Life Sciences | $405.60 $405.60 Ce"t'alzL'f: Ssﬁa'e"ces' $374.60 $374.60
X2.
#2-17 Altosid® Pro-G 1 10 oz Shaker Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-18 Altosid® Duplex-G 1 40# Bag Per 40# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences | $598.40 $598.40 Central Life Sciences $598.40 $598.40
#2-19 Altosid® Duplex-G 1 1,000# Supersack Per 1ki# Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Central Life Sciences $29,200.00 $29,200.00
#-20|  Monomolecular 1 55 Gal Drum Per Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Larviciding Film
Non- ting/settli Clarke, Cocob
-1 | Non-separating/settling| 55 Gal Drum PerDrum  |BVA-BVA2 (55 gl drum)| $1,099.45 | $1,099.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid arke, Locobear, $1,406.30 $1,406.30
Larviciding Oil Mineral Oil 10%
Valent BioSciences -
BTI/Meth 40# Bag (includ
#2-22 /Methoprene 1 2g (include Per Bag VectoPrime FG (40lb | $158.00 $158.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Granular Mixture SDS/Label) bag)
Valent BioSciences -
BTI (All Availabl 5 Gal C
#2-23 (All Available 1 al Case/ PerCase | Vectobac 12As (2x2.5gl| $167.50 $167.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Formulations) formulation
case)
) Valent BioSciences -
BTI (All Available . . . . X X
#2-24 R 1 30 Gal Drum Per Drum Vectobac 12AS (30 gl $1,005.00 $1,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Formulations)
drum)
BTI (All Availabl Central Life Sci
#2-25 (All Available 1 35 # Bag Per Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid entralHie sciences, $455.35 $455.35
Formulations) Fourstar BTl CRG
#2-26| BTl (All Available 1 404 Bag Per Bag Valent BioSciences - $76.40 $76.40 Summit $200.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Formulations) Vectobac G (40lb bag)
#o27| BT (AllAvailable 1 10004 Bag Per Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid Summit $1,775.00 | $1,775.00 Central Life Sciences, | ¢)3 50000 | $13,000.00
Formulations) Fourstar BTl CRG
Valent BioSciences -
#2-28 [Bacillus Sphaericus WSP| 1 Case (800) Per Case Vectolex WSP (800 $682.00 $682.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WSP/cs)
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RFQ 22-0044-3 Annual Pricing for Mosquito Control Chemicals
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Adapco, LLC
Lake Mary, FL

Target Specialty Products

Norcross, GA

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
St. Charles, IL

# Items Qry Con’Famer uom Manufacturer Urut eEl Manufacturer Urnt Tz Manufacturer Ur"t VeiEl
Size Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
Bacillus Sphaericus (All Valent BioSci -
#-29 | Bacillus Sphaericus ( 1 40# Bag Per 40# Bag alent Blosciences $233.60 $233.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Available Particle Sizes) Vectolex FG (40Ib bag)
Bacillus Sphaericus & . . . . . . Central Life Sceinces,
#2- 1 4 Per C No B No B No B No B No B No B 4. 4.
30 BTI WSP 00/case er Case o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid Fourstar MBG WSP $684.00 $684.00
Bacillus Sphaericus & Valent BioSciences -
#2-31 BTIpWSP 1 800/Case Per Case Vectomax WSP (800 $1,475.00 $1,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WSP/cs)
#2-32 | SPinosad (All Available | - Case Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Natular XRT 180 | ¢g5, o $900.94
Types) Day Tablet, 220/case
#-33 | SPinosad (All Available | b, b oo ity Quantit|  Per 40 Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Clarke, Natular G30 $679.60 $679.60
Types Granule, 40Ib Bag
3
#3-1 |Dilvent O";;)BVA Grade| 55 Gal Drum Per Drum BVA- 'ZVAL;’ 558 | ¢101530 | $1,015.30 BVA $880.00 $880.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
rum
Total Cost $55,689.24 $193,265.34 $350,003.05
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