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#0-1

LUCAS 3, v3.1 Chest Compression 

System, includes hard shell case, 

slim back plate, two (2) patient 

straps, one (1) stabilization strap, 

two (2) suction cups, one (1) 

rechargeable battery and 

instructions for use with the 

device (Product #: 99576-

000063)

1 Each $16,214.15 $16,214.15 $18,917.00 $18,917.00 $ 20,689.66 $ 20,689.66 $ 21,803.3 $ 21,803.3

#0-2
LUCAS External Power Supply 

(Product #: 11576-000071)
1 Each $369 $369 No Bid No Bid $508.58 $508.58 $512.58 $512.58

#0-3

LUCAS Battery – Dark Grey – 

Rechargeable LiPo (Product #: 

11576-000080)

1 Each $693.75 $693.75 No Bid No Bid $956.18 $956.18 $963.19 $963.19

#0-4

LIFEPAK 15 V4 Monitor/Defib – 

Manual & AED, Trending, 

Noninvasive Pacing, SPpO2, NIBP, 

12-Lead ECG, EtCO2, BT. Incl at 

N/C: two (2) pr QC Electrodes 

and one (1) Test Load per device, 

one (1) service manual CD 

(Product #: 99577-001955)

1 Each $32,793.30 $32,793.30 $36,893.44 $36,893.44 $40,657.75 $40,657.75 $42,070.12 $42,070.12

#0-5

Ship Kit – QUIK-COMBO Therapy 

Cable; two (2) rolls 100mm 

Paper; RC-12 Patient Cable, 12 

ft.; NIBP Hose, Coiled; NIBP Cuff, 

Reusable, adult; 12-Lead ECG 

Cable, 4-Wire Limb Leads, 8 ft; 12-

Lead ECG Cable, 6-Wire 

Precordial attachment (Product 

#: 41577-000285)

1 Each $0.01 $0.01 No Bid No Bid $1 $1 No Bid No Bid

#0-6

LP 15 Lithium-ion Battery 5.7-

amp hrs (Product #: 21330-

001176)

3 Each $454.50 $1,363.50 $564.77 $1,694.31 $626.43 $1,879.29 $595.38 $1,786.14

#0-7
LP 15 AC Power Adapter (Product 

#: 11140-000098)
1 Each $1,624.50 $1,624.50 No Bid No Bid $2,239.01 $2,239.01 $2,132.06 $2,132.06

#0-8
AC Power cord (Product #: 11140-

000015)
1 Each $78.75 $78.75 No Bid No Bid $108.54 $108.54 $109.18 $109.18

#0-9

Masimo M-LNCSCI, Adult 

Reusable SpO2 only Sensor 

(Product #: 11171-000046)

1 Each $262.60 $262.60 No Bid No Bid $417.62 $417.62 $397.56 $397.56

#0-10

Masimo M-LNCSP, Pediatric 

Reusable SpO2 only Sensor 

(Product #: 11171-000047)

1 Each $262.20 $262.20 No Bid No Bid $417.62 $417.62 $397.56 $397.56

#0-11
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Infant 

(Product #: 11160-000011)
1 Each $21.75 $21.75 No Bid No Bid $29.98 $29.98 $30.02 $30.02

#0-12
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Child 

(Product #: 11160-000013)
1 Each $24.75 $24.75 $23.33 $23.33 $34.11 $34.11 $33.61 $33.61

#0-13
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Large Adult 

(Product #: 11160-000017)
1 Each $34.50 $34.50 $35.94 $35.94 $47.55 $47.55 $46.79 $46.79

#0-14
NIBP Cuff-Reusable, Adult X 

Large (Product #: 11160-000019)
1 Each $48.75 $48.75 $50.93 $50.93 $67.19 $67.19 $67.12 $67.12

#0-15

LIFEPAK 15 Basic carry case with 

right and left pouches; shoulder 

strap included (Product #: 11577-

000002)

1 Each $324 $324 $403.24 $403.24 $446.56 $446.56 $450.08 $450.08

#0-16
LIFEPAK 15 Carry case top pouch 

(Product #: 11220-000028)
1 Each $58.50 $58.50 No Bid No Bid $80.63 $80.63 $81.42 $81.42

#0-17
LIFEPAK 15 Carry case back 

pouch (Product #: 11260-000039)
1 Each $83.25 $83.25 No Bid No Bid $114.74 $114.74 $116.19 $116.19

#0-18
Titan III Wi-Fi Gateway (Product 

#: 21996-000109)
1 Each $1,261.60 $1,261.60 No Bid No Bid $1,424.99 $1,424.99 $220.98 $220.98

#0-19 Delivery 1 Each $532.74 $532.74 No Bid No Bid $1 $1 $115 $115

*MBE

BID 23-0152-2 PURCHASE OF A CHEST COMPRESSION 

SYSTEM, MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR AND ACCESSORIES 

(ARPA)                                                                                                                                                                 

BID DUE: NOVEMBER 7, 2023 @ 2PM

Total Cost

*Medical Solutions, Inc. 

Brookln Park, MN

Quadmed, Inc.                                            

Jacksonville, FL

School Health Corporation                                   

Rolling Meadows, IL

Stryker Sales LLC, through 

its Medical Division                                       

Redmond, WA

$71,332.90$70,122.00$58,018.19$56,051.60


