BID 21-0110-5

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: SEPTEMBER 9,2021 @ 2:00P.M.

Bob Barker Strong
. Central Poly-
Company, Inc. Medical Bag Co Cedar Promo
Fuquay-Varina, Partners, LLC Lin:en r:” Hinsdale, IL
NC Pineville, NC !
Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ Item| Unit
ipti TY Total Total Total Total
Item Description Q Item # Price ora Item # Price e Item # | Price ora # Price ora
inyl Gl - Small
Vinyl Gloves - Small 1 NOBID|  $0.00 smp-4002 | $38.15 | $3.815.00 $0.00 Cordova | ¢40.90 | $4.090.00
L (cases) 4064-S
Vinyl Gloves - Cordova
> Medium (cases) 150 NO BID $0.00 SMP-4003 | $38.15 $5,722.50 $0.00 4064-M $40.90 $6,135.00
inyl Gl -
A (::::S) Large | 250 NOoBID|  $000 | smpa00s | $38.15 | $9,537.50 $0.00 et | $4090 | $1022500
Vinyl 6l - X-
inyl Gloves - X- 1 359 NoBID|  $0.00 smp-4005 | $38.15 | $13,352.50 $0.00 Cordova | 44090 | $14315.00
4, Large (cases) 4064-XL
Nitrile Gloves - Small Rhino Health,
5. (cases) 150 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Inc. RHI01-S $89.80 $13,470.00
Nitrile Gloves - Rhino Health,
6. Medium (cases) 200 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Inc. RHIO1-M $89.80 $17,960.00
Nitril Gloves - Large Rhino Health,
7 (cases) 300 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Inc. RHIOL-L $89.80 $26,940.00
Nitril Gloves - X- Rhino Health,
L [Fangel(cases) 350 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 nc. RH1010! $89.80 $31,430.00
Nitrile Gloves - 2XL Rhino Health,
b (cases) 100 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Inc. RH101-2XL. $89.80 $8,980.00
Alcohol Free Hand Cleancide
Sanitizer Wipes | 200 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 WDP;"ZO‘ZCT .| $59.88 | $11,976.00
10. (cases) canisters/cs
ilet Tissue - 2
Toilet Tissue - 2ply |,500 NoBID|  $0.00 $0.00 Resolute | ¢ 4277| $8554000 | woem $0.00
11, (cases) #276
12. Mop Head (cases) | 800 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
13. Mop Handle (each) | 200 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
BBC-
I I NO BID 0.00
14, Sheets (dozen) 400 SHE6104P $62.00 $24,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $
TOTAL
BID $24,800.00 $32,427.50 $85,540.00 $145,521 .00
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BID 21-0110-5

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: SEPTEMBER 9,2021 @ 2:00P.M.

*Cox Creative Staples
Product and *Media PPE, Hard Time Contract &
Construction, Inc. Products Commercial,
Inc. Miami, FL Rome,GA LLC
Savannah, GA Savannah, GA
Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ I it
Item Description Qry If:m # Pr?::e Total If:r:f# Prri‘::e Total If::\f# Pr?tl:e M °"f# " l::"i‘::e R
Vinyl Gloves - Small AmerCare- Ammex Worklife
" (cases) 100 $15.36 $1,536.00 Edge #22991 $52.50 $5,250.00 T $33.00 $3,300.00 Brands YM4512 $68.30 $6,830.00
Vinyl Gloves - AmerCare- Ammex Worklife
5 Medium (cases) 150 $15.36 $2,304.00 Edge #22992 $52.50 $7.875.00 L cpx3aa100 $33.00 $4,950.00 Brands VM4513 $68.30 $10,245.00
Vinyl Gloves - Large AmerCare- Ammex Worklife
3 (cases) 250 $15.36 $3,840.00 Edge #22993 $5250 | $13,125.00 . $33.00 $8.250.00 Brands V4514 $68.30 $17.,075.00
Vinyl Gloves - X- AmerCare- Emerald Worklife
4 L) 350 $15.36 $5,376.00 Edge #22994 $5250 | $18,375.00 Rnsi09 $38.50 $13,475.00 arands VMABLE $68.30 $23,905.00
Nitrile Gloves - Small Care- Sri Trang i
rile Glove 150 $2048 | $307200 | A" | so800 | $1470000 | usa |$8800| $1320000 | WKe | 411780 | $17.67000
5. (cases) Pilot #45991 e Brands VM4515
Nitrile Gloves - Care- Sri Trang Tradex
S 200 $2048 | $4.096.00 | 2™ | 59800 | $19.60000 | usa |$8800| $17,600.00 | International | $117.80 | $23,560.00
Medium (cases) Pilot #45992
6. #10420106 NMD200BLK
Nitril 6l s-L ) Sri Trang Tradex
itril Glove: arge 300 $20.48 $6.144.00 Piflir;\e;itlsr':gs $98.00 | $29,400.00 USA $88.00] $26,400.00 International | $117.80 | $35,340.00
7 (cases) ° #10421106 NLG200BLK
Nitril 61 s - X- } Sri Trang Tradex
il Blove 350 $2048 | $7.168.00 Pi’;’:ﬁ‘;”:g .| $98.00 | $3430000 | usa [$88.00| $30800.00 | International | $117.80 | $41,230.00
8 Large (cases) #10422106 NXL200BLK
Nitrile Gloves - 2XL Sri Trang Tradex
e 100 $20.48 $2,048.00 N/A $0.00 USA $88.00 $8,800.00 International | $61.71 $6,171.00
8. (cases) #10423106 NXXL6201
Alcohol Free Hand N°V”Z'Te"°s
R : Made 80
Sanitizer Wipes 200 $0.00 wipes/tub 50 $7250 | $14,500.00 $0.00 NO sKU $0.00
10 (cases) tubs per cs
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BID 21-0110-5

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: SEPTEMBER 9,2021 @ 2:00P.M.

*Cox Creative

Staples
Product and *Media PPE, Hard Time Contract &
Construction, Inc. Products Commercial,
Inc. Miami, FL Rome, GA LLC
Savannah, GA Savannah, GA
Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit Manf/ Item| Unit
ipti Total Total Total Total
Item Description Qry Item # Price ota Item # Price ota Item # | Price ora # Price ota
2 Ply-500 Sotidel
Toilet Tissue - 2ply Sheets Pk96 Boardwalk America
(dEes) 2000 $71.68 | $143,360.00 per cs, Brand $4750 | $95,000.00 e oy $4259| $85,180.00 T $41.31 $82,620.00
1. b. 6212
Boardwalk Rubbermaid
Mop Head (cases) | 800 $12.73 $10,184.00 N/A $0.00 #BWK67020| $44.33 $35,464.00 Commercial $43.20 $34,560.00
12. 165 3486266
Impact Worklife
13, Mop Handle (each) | 200 $21.76 $4,352.00 N/A $0.00 o ol $40.61 $8,122.00 S— $8.43 $1,686.00
14, Sheets (dozen) | 400 $100.92| $40,368.00 N/A $0.00 ;:;;“5"7"1 $56.89| $22,756.00 NO BID
TOTAL
BID $233,848.00 $252,125.00 $278,297.00 $300,892.00
*Malor &
ICS Jail Company,
Supplies, Inc. Inc.
Waco, TX New York,
NY
Manf/ Unit Manf/ Unit
ipti Total Total
Item escoiption Qry Item # | Price ke Item # | Price bty
Vinyl Gloves - Small Ammex Xylem
100 56.80 5,680.00 87.21 8,721.00
L (cases) GPX3 $ $ xraz | ¥ $
Vinyl Gloves - Ammex Xylem
150 56.80 8,520.00 87.21 13,081.50
2. Medium (cases) 6PX3 $ $ XFF313 $ $
Vinyl Gloves - Large Ammex Xylem
250 56.80 14,200.00 87.21 21,802.50
3. (cases) 6PX3 $ $14, XFF313 $ $
Vinyl Gloves - X- Ammex Xylem
350 56.80 19,880.00 87.21 30,523.50
4. Large (cases) 6PX3 $ $ XFF313 $ $
Nitrile Gloves - Small Ammex Xylem
150 189.28 28,392.00 121.77 18,265.50
5. (cases) APFN $189 $28.39 sernnas | ¥ $
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BID 21-0110-5

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: SEPTEMBER 9,2021 @ 2:00P.M.

*Malor &
ICS Jail Company,
Supplies, Inc. Inc.
Waco, TX New York,
NY
Nitrile Gloves - Ammex Xylem
200 189.28 37,856.00 12177 24,354.00
6. Medium (cases) APFN $ $ XFFNN43 $ $
Nitril Gloves - Large Ammex Xylem
300 189.28 56,784.00 121.77 36,531.00
7. (cases) APFN $ $ XFFNN43 $ $
Nitril Gloves - X- Ammex Xylem
350 189.28 66,248.00 12177 42,619.50
8. Large (cases) APFN $ $ XFFNN43 $ b
Nitrile Gloves - 2XL Xylem
9, (cases) 100 | NO BID $0.00 XFFNN43 $121.77| $12,177.00
Alcohol Free Hand el ol
e . edline ylem
Sanitizer Wipes 200 MSC351201 $194.21| $38,842.00 e $29.99 | $5,998.00
10. (cases)
Toilet Tissue - 2ply Xylem
1" (cases) 2000| NoOBID $0.00 - $27.21 | $54,420.00
12 | Mop Head (cases) |800| nosm $0.00 e | $5052 | $40,416.00
13. | Mop Handle (each) | 200 | Noem $0.00 e | $512 | $1.02400
Ladds ol
Sheets (dozen) | 400 | Corp. | $76.42 | $30,568.00 XFYF:T3 $34.68 | $13,872.00
14 L0202-180
TOTAL
BID $306,970.00 $323,805.50

*MBE

Procurement Specialis

7y
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